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Plan New Women's Dormitory On Mooreland Campus 

T HE recommendation of a special 
committee that a new women's dor­ 

mitory be erected on the Mooreland 
Campus when "the time is propitious to 
proceed with this undertaking" was ap­ 
proved at the annual meeting of the 
Board of Trustees held in the Physics 
Lecture Room of the Tome Building at 
Commencement on June 2. The Trustees 
also approved the continuance of the 
college commons and suggested further 
consideration of a proposal to rebuild 
the Old Gym for this purpose and they 
also recommended studying plans for 
the complete renovation and reequip­ 
ment of the chemistry laboratories. 

For some time a special committee 
has been considering the need for a 
new women's dormitory and the possible 
site for this building. For several years 
the women students have been housed in 
Metzger Hall, the Gibbs House, which 
is also called the Senior House and 
which is owned by the College, and the 
Parker House, opposite Metzger, which 
is rented. During the last academic year 
and in the present Summer Session, the 
Phi Delta Theta fraternity house has 
been occupied by women. In the coming 
year to open October 8, the Beta Theta 
Pi fraternity house, which has been 
rented by the College, will also accom­ 
modate sixteen women students, result­ 
ing in the fact that the women will be 
housed in five separate units. Those 
residing in the Phi Delta Theta and 
Beta Theta Pi houses will take their 
meals in the College Commons in the 
Old Gym, while those residing m 
Metzger, the Parker House and the 
Gibbs House will eat at Metzger. 

For a time at least one other site on 
Louther and College Streets was being 
considered, and this site may yet be 
purchased by the College. However the 

Trustee committee recommended that 
the new building be erected on Moore­ 
land. This committee was composed of 
Samuel M. Goodyear, Judge E. M. 
Biddle, Jr., ·s. M. Drayer, and Boyd 
Lee Spahr, ex-officio. The recommend­ 
ation approved by the Board was as 
follows: 

"Your Committee is of the unanimous 
opinion and accordingly recommends 
that if and when the Board of Trustees 
sees proper to begin the erection of a 
women's dormitory that the said build­ 
mg be erected on the Mooreland 
Campus, adequate to house at least 125 
girls, if and when the time is propitious 
to proceed with this undertaking." 

Since the termination of the war, 
members of the committee have said 
that they believe plans should be pre­ 
pared at once for the erection of a 
building of native limestone conform­ 
ing to the other buildings of the campus 
and that it should be one to house 150 
women students. The question will 
doubtless be considered early this fall 
at a meeting of the Executive Committee 
if the Board is not called 'into a meet­ 
ing earlier than the mid-winter meeting 
in December. 

At any forthcoming meeting the Exec­ 
utive Committee will also consider plans 
and costs for the renovation of the 
chemical laboratories in Tome. An 
engineer is preparing a study which will 
be submitted to the Trustees. Early 
estimates indicate that this work may 
cost from $50,000 to $75,000. It will 
provide for all new modern laboratory 
equipment, the installation of new hoods 
with exhaust fans, new storage space 
and the conversion of the museum into 
a laboratory. 

Another committee composed of 
Andrew H. Phelps, Merkel Landis and 
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Judge Karl E. Richards recommended 
the continuance of the operation of the 
commons in the post-war period. This 
committee also proposed the desirability 
of considering the transformation of the 

Old Gym into a fine dining hall ~nd 
suggested further study of this proiect 
when funds could be available and when 
it would be possible to secure the neces­ 
sary materials. 

Named President of University of Redlands 
D R. GEORGE H. ARMACOST, '26, 

acting dean of men at'William and 
Mary College, Williamsburg, Va., was 
elected President of the University of 
Redlands, a liberal arts college in 
southern California, in June. Going to 
William and Mary in 193 7 as associate 
professor of education, he was chairman 
of the Department of Education, director 
of the summer session and acting dean 
of men when he was selected for the 
Redlands presidency. 

The University of Redlands, founded 
in 1909, is at Redlands, California, lo­ 
cated in the center of the orange-growing 
district, 66 miles east of Los Angeles. 
It is a co-educational institution, under 
Baptist auspices, and has an enrollment 
of abour SOO students with a faculty of 
70 members. The campus consists of 
100 acres on which there are buildings 
valued at more than $1,500,000. The 
endowment of the university exceeds 
$2,500,000. 

Following · his graduation from the 
college in 1926, Dr. Armacost taught 
science in the high school at Kane, Pa., 
where he later became principal, while 
doing gr..iduate work in Teachers Col­ 
lege, Columbia University, fro.m which he 
received his M.A. in 1930 and the Ph.D. 
in 1940. He was a teacher in the sum­ 
mer sessions at Columbia University 
from 19''1 to 1937. He also did gradu­ 
ate work in education at Johns Hopkins 
University. . . . 

Holding membership in vanous pro­ 
fessional and educational associations, at 
Dickinson he became a member of the 
Commons Club. He is also a member 
of Kapp1 Delta Pi and Phi _Delta Kappa 
fraternities and of the Baptist Church. 

Graduating from the Franklin High 
School, Reistertown, Md., in 1922, .he 
entered the College and graduated wit? 
an A.B. degree in 1926. Known to his 
colleagL1es as "Army" he was on the 
staff of the Microcosm, served as as­ 
sistant editor of the Handbook, was 
president of the Union Philosophical 
Literary Society and active in the affairs 
of the Y. M. C. A., Glee Club and 
Greek Club. 

Born in Upperco, Md., on May 6, 
1905, he is the son of J. Franklin and 
Matilda Nolte Armacost. He was mar­ 
ried to Miss Verda Gay Hayden of Ober­ 
lin, Ohio, on June 14, 1933. They have 
three sons, Peter Michael and Samuel, 
aged 10, 8 and 6, and a three year old 
daughter, Mary. 

Conducts Important Experiments 
It can now be revealed that Dr. E. A. 

Vuilleumier, dean of the College and 
head of the department of chemistry, 
conducted many experiments during the 
war for the National Defense Research 
Committee of which the chairman is Dr. 
James B. Conant, president of Harvard 
Urnvers1t~. As early as April, 1942, Dean 
Vmlleumier received a letter from Dr. 
Conant, thanking him for his studies on 
Eutectic Diagrams and for his "fine co­ 
operation and for your very substantial 
help." 

The Eutectic Diagrams were made in 
many experiments with chemicals used 
in the manufacture of explosives. Prof. 
V uilleumier does not now know whether 
these studies concerned the development 
of the atomic bomb, though he does know 
that many chemists were absorbed in the 
studies of the project. 
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Call Prof. Ayres To University Study Center 

Prof. Frank Ayres, Jr. 

PROF. FRANK AYRES, JR., Susan 
Powers Hoffman Professor of Mathe­ 

matics, and head of the department at 
the College, was called into government 
service in June to become a member of 
the mathematics branch at one of the 
University Study Centers set up by the 
Army for military personnel in the 
European theater of operations. While 
he first thought he would be sent to the 
Center at Shrivenharn, · England, he 
arrived on August 7 at Biarritz where 
the branch head is Prof. J. Irving Tracey, 
'06, who is a member of the faculty of 
Yale University. 

Prof. Ayres has been granted a year's 
leave of absence. C Chauncey Butler, 
graduate student of the University of 
Pennsylvania, has been appointed in­ 
structor in mathematics at the College, 
and will aid in carrying courses normally 
taught by Prof. Ayres. 

At Biarritz the mathematics branch is 
composed of 23 teachers, 18 of them 
civilians, and 5 from the Army. Prof. 
Ayres is living in the Villa Flura, a short 
distance from the University. He sailed 
for Europe, leaving New York on July 
26 on the Queen Elizabeth, landed in 

C. Chauncey Butler 

Scotland, then went to London and 
across the channel to Dieppe. Follow­ 
ing a three-day trip to Paris, he journeyed 
to Biarritz, arriving there August 7. 

Prof. Ayres, who has been a member 
of the College faculty for the past 17 
years, received acclaim early in the war 
when he wrote a mathematics text book 
which was used by the Army Air Corps 
in its preflight college training program. 
During his absence Mrs. Ayres and their 
daughter, Margaret, will maintain their 
home in Carlisle. 

Through the recommendation of the 
placement bureau of the University of 
Pennsylvania, the services of Mr. Butler 
were secured in June. 

Following his graduation from the 
Bellevue High School in 1922, Mr. But­ 
ler attended the U. S. Naval Academy 
for 3 years where he was a member of 
the gymnastics team. He then took 
work in mechanical engineering at Car­ 
negie Tech for 2 years before beginning 
to specialize in mathematics. He re­ 
ceived his A. B. degree from the Univer­ 
sity of Pittsburgh in 1929, and his A. M. 
degree from Teachers College, Columbia 
University, in 1936. Since 1929 he has 
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been a graduate student at the Univer­ 
sity of Pennsylvania in mathematics, and 
has completed practically all of his work 
for his doctorate. He has also taken 
summer courses at the University of 
Minnesota, West Chester State Teachers 
College, and the University of Pennsyl­ 
vania. 

From 1926 to 1929 Mr. Butler was 
physical director at the West Pennsyl­ 
vania School for the Blind in Pittsburgh. 
He then taught mathematics for a year 
in the Winnwood School, Lake Grove, 
N. Y. before becoming a member of the 

faculty of the Radnor High School, 
Wayne, Penna., where, from 1931 to 
1944, he taught mathematics, was foot 
ball and tennis coach and assistant trac 
coach. Last year he was teacher of 
maithematics and physics and dean of 
boys at the Daycroft School, Stamford, 
Conn. 

Mr. Butler is a member of Phi DeH~ 
Kappa fraternity, the National Cou_nc1 

of Teachers of Mathematics, and vanous 
national educational associations. He 
has traveled extensively abroad. 

Rounds Out a .Half Century With F & D 
GUY LEROY STEVICK, '85, vice­ 

president in charge of the Pacific 
Executive Office of the Fidelity & De­ 
posit Company of Maryland, and dean 
of West Coast surety men, rounded out 
his 50th year with the Company on July 
1. Recognition was given to him in 
The Listening Post, weekly bulletin .of 
the Company, which carried a short 
sketch of his life, and paid tribute to 
his business ability and character. It 
concluded with a commendation of an 
official from another company saying, 
"Perhaps the greatest com12Jiment that 
can be paid Guy LeRoy Stevick rs to say 
of him that his word is as good as his 
bond". 

Probably outstanding among 'the many 
brilliant achievements of his surety 
career is the part he played in obtai~ing 
for surety companies the largest premrnm 
ever paid for a bond. It was for the 
performance of the nearly $50,000,000. 
contract for the Hoover Dam and Power 
Plant for which the premium totalled 
more than $825,000. Indicative of Mr. 
Stevick's ability to size up a situation is 
the fact that the final agreement between 
the contractors anc! the participating 
sureties contained no material changes 
from his original proposals. 

After his graduation in 1885, Mr. 
Stevick was graduated with . an _LLB. 
degree in 1888 from the University of 

Pennsylvania, was admitted to the Bar, 
and s'tarted the practice of law in Ph:la­ 
delphia. In 1889, he married Manon 
Pratt, daughter of Col. Richard H. Pratt, 
founder and commandant of the Carlisle 
Indian School. Shortly afterward the 
young couple moved to Denver whe~e 
Mr. Stevick became a successful practi­ 
tioner and later a leading authority on 
water rights and special lecturer at Har­ 
vard and Columbia Universities. One 
of his clients was the Fidelity & Deposit 
Company which appointed him as an _ad­ 
v1smg underwriter for its representatives 
in California. Some time later the Com­ 
pany asked him to go to San Francisco 
to take over the executive office there 
which he did. 

Presents Brookings Report 
After the war government will cost 

Americans about twice as much as rn 
1940, a report of the Brookings Institu­ 
tion estimated in June. Lewis H. Kim­ 
mel, '20, who has been with the Insti­ 
tution for the past four years submitted 
the report which stated: "The debt 
service would not represent the prii:uary 
post-war fiscal problem." It is predicted 
that instead it would be "large and 
growing expenditures" for all functions 
of the government. 
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Becomes President of General Alumni Association 

PAUL LOOMIS HUI1CHISON, '18, 
'23L, prominent attorney of Harris­ 

burg, Pa., son of Dr. William A. Hut­ 
chison, '92, former headmaster of 
Conway Hall, was elected president of 
the General Alumni Association at the 
annual meeting on June 2, succeeding 
Judge Karl E. Richards, '11. Other 
officers were elected at that meeting, and 
announcement made of the results of 
the annual mail election. 

Dr. Daniel P. Ray, '03, of Johns­ 
town, was reelected vice-president; C. 
Wendell Holmes, ';21, of Upper Darby, 
secretary; and Dr. Harry B. Stock, '91, 
of Carlisle, treasurer. 

It was announced that Harry L. Price, 
'96, had been reelected an alumni trustee 
for the term expiring in 1949. 

The Class of 1945 elected Mrs. Nancy 
Tatnall Fuller as class representative for 
a 3-year period. 
It was announced that the five alumni 

elected to the Alumni Council from the 
ten nominees for the 3-year term to ex­ 
pire in 1948 were as follows: Glenn E. 
Todd, '12, manufacturer of Carlisle, Pa.; 
C. Wendell Holmes, '21, teacher of 
Upper Darby; Charles S. Williams, '26, 
judge of Lycoming County, of Williams­ 
port, Pa. ; W. Reese Hitchens, '28, 
lawyer of Wilmington, Del.; and 
Christian F. Spahr, '33, medical pub­ 
lisher of Philadelphia. 

Paul Hutchison was born in Philadel­ 
phia on October 3, 1898, the son of Dr. 
William Albert and Mary Loomis 
Hutchison. He prepared for college at 
Conway Hall. Upon his graduation from 
the College in 1918 he enlisted in the 
U. S. Navy, serving in World War I 
as a radio electrician. After his dis­ 
charge from the service he taught school 
a year at Lewistown, and then entered 
the Law School, graduating with an 
LLB. degree in 1923, and receiving an 
A.M. from the College that year. After 
a year's clerkship in a lawyer's office 
in Florida, he became assistant trust 
officer of the Lincoln Trust Company, 
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Paul L. Hutchison 

Scranton, Pa., in 1924. From 1924 to 
1931 he was counsel to the Pennsylvania 
Department of Forests and Waters, and 
from 1931 to 1934, deputy attorney 
general of Pennsylvania. From 1935 to 
1941 he was in a law partnership with 
Robert E. Woodside, '26, now judge of 
Dauphin County, and Phillips Brooks 
Scott, '21. Since 1941 he has been in 
private practice. 

He married Florence Baker, '17, of 
Mt. Holly Springs, on July 15, 1926. 

Long active in alumni and fraternity 
affairs, he served as president of the 
Dickinson Club of Harrisburg in 1938, 
and since 1933 has been chapter visitor 
of the Dickinson chapter of Phi Kappa 
Sigma fraternity and is treasurer or: the 
board of trustees of the fraternity. He 
has been a trustee and lay leader of 
the Camp Hill Methodist Church, and 
since 1941 · has been a trustee of the 
Methodist Children's Home at Shire­ 
manstown. He has served as com­ 
mander in the American Legion, and at 
the present time is a lieutenant colonel 
of the Pennsylvania State Guard, at­ 
tached to the staff of the Adjutant 
General. He is a member of the board 
of directors of the Harrisburg Rotary 
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Club, and of Cumberland Star Lodge 
No. 197, F. & A. M., of Carlisle, and 
also of the Dauphin County Bar Asso­ 
ciation and the American Bar Associa­ 
tion. 

This year he was general chairman 
of the Harrisburg area in the Red Cross 
campaign, and since last year has been 
on the delezate council of the Harns- b 
burg Welfare Federation. 

27 New Lifers Raise Total to 536 
TWENTY-SEVEN new subscriptions 

to life membership in the General 
Alumni Association have been received 
since the publication of the life member­ 
ship roster in the May issue of the 

. DICKINSON ALUMNUS, raising the total 
to 536. 

The new additions began on May 23 
when two coeds sent in their subscrip­ 
tions on the same day. One came from 
Mrs. H. M. Weitzel, the former Emma 
Wentzel, of the Class of 1934, who lives 
in Shippensburg. The other came from 
Miss Jeanie R. Deans, '38, who lives in 
North Adams, Mass. 

As a graduation present, William K. 
Hartzell bought a life membership for 
his daughter, Dorothy J. Hartzell, '45, 
who received her diploma in June. 

On the last day of May a subscription 
came from William C. Schultz, Jr., '30, 
who lives in Berwyn. 
When he was home on furlough on 

June 4, Pfc. James_ E. N~len, '.30, who 
was then stationed in Mississippi, became 
a Lifer. On that same day Milton E. 
Flower, '31, of the Carlisle High School 
faculty, and the Rev. Ralph L. Minker, 
'30, superintenden_t of the Ferns ln­ 
dustrial School, W1lmmgton, Del., made 
their subscriptions. A few days later a 
subscription was received from Rev. J. 
Roy Strock, D.D., '_03_, secretary of _the 
Board of Foreign Missions of the U111ted 
Lutheran Church in America, who was 
then in Baltimore. The next name to be 
listed was that of Capt. David _Streger, 
'39, then serving with the Army in Italy. 
The following one was that _of David 
A. Henderson, '12, who lives m Gallup, 
N. Mex. . 

While serving with the Navy m the 
Pacific, Ensign J. Franklin Gayman, '42, 

sent in his subscription which was re­ 
ceived on June 18. The last two sub­ 
scriptions that month came from Pa_ul 
Walke[, '21, who is with Columbia Pic­ 
tures in New York City, and Lina M. 
Hartzell, '10, member of the faculty of 
the Carlisle High School. 

While on a visit 'to the College fol­ 
lowing two years of service abroad with 
the Army, Capt. Arthur R. Mangan, '37, 
wrote a check for life membership. On 
the same day a subscription came from 
Howard J. Loos of the Class of 1938 of 
Schuylkill Haven. 

At the organization dinner of the 
Dickinson Club of Chicago John W. 
Garrett, '19, who is comptroller of the 
John R. Thompson Company, restau­ 
ranteurs, became a Lifer. 

The next subscription came from Lt. 
Harry J. Nuttle, '38, who is with the 
Bureau of Supplies and Accounts of the 
Navy Department in Washington. 

On July 11 Harry E. Hinebauch~ '34, 
and his wife and classmate, Priscilla 
McConnell Hinebach, became Lifers. 
While on a trip from Ft. Eustis, Va., 

to the Carlisle Barracks with a detail of 
German prisoners, Lt. Louis M. Hatter, 
'41, called at the College and became a 
Lifer. A few days later a $40 check 
arrived from Capt. Roy R. Kuebler, '33, 
former member of the faculty and then 
on Okinawa. 

On July 16 checks were received from 
William S. Jenkins, '31, attorney of 
Cumberland, Md., and Lt. (j .g.) John 
J. Ketterer, '43, now a patient in the 
U. S. Naval Hospital, Sampson, N. Y., 
after service in the Pacific. 

The final July subscription was re­ 
ceived from Lt. Donald R. Morrison, 
'41, who is serving in the Pacific as a 
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clinical psychologist in the 31 Lth Gen­ 
eral Hospital, where he is assigned. to 
the neuro-psychiatric section and assists 
in the diagnosis and treatment of mental 
disorders. 

Three new subscriptions were received 
during the month of August. The first 
of these· came from George Compton 
Kerr '18 executive secretary of Good­ 
will 'Indu~tries of Scranton, Inc Max I. 
Mechanic '1 7 of Allentown, made his 
subscribti~n when he visited the College 
on Auzust 18 to enroll his son as a 

b .. 
student. The third subscription was re- 
ceived from Rev. Wayne Channell, 
D. D., '96, of Mountain Home, Pa., re­ 
tired clergyman of the Philadelphia Con­ 
ference. 

Subscriptions to life memb~rship are 
not Alumni Fund contributions, and 
Alumni Fund contributions cannot pur­ 
chase life membership subscriptions. 
There are three classes of membership in 
the General Alumni Association: class 
membership, which costs $1 a year and 
to which an alumnus is eligible for only 
three years after his graduation from 
college; annual membership of $2 a 
year; and life membership, which costs 
$40 and ends the payment of annual 
dues and carries with it a life subscrip­ 
tion to the DICKINSON ALUMNUS. The 
$40 life membership fee may be paid in 
full or in installments of $10 or $20. 
Subscriptions should be sent to the 
Dickinson Alumnus, West College, Car­ 
lisle, Pa. 

More Books Available 
Fifty additional copies of "The 

Broken Circle," the 'biography of. the 
late Professor Paul H. Doney, written 
by his father, Dr. Carl G. Doney, have 
been presented to the College. Any 
subscriber to the Paul H. Doney Me­ 
morial Fund is mailed a copy of 'The 
Broken Circle." Receipts from these 
contributions are used for the purchase 
of books in the Paul H. Doney alcove 
in the College Library. 

Meet at 15th Reunion 
The Class of '30 held its fifteenth 

reunion during the college commence­ 
ment week-end of June 2 and 3. The 
highlight of the reunion was the banquet 
held at the Molly Pitcher Hotel on Sun­ 
day, June 3. Fifteen members and 
guests were present. Letters and cards 
were read by the acting president from 
class members who were unable to be 
present-a number of whom are in the 
service in this country or abroad. 

After the meal was served, the mem­ 
bers present discussed the class gift to 
the College and decided to make a re­ 
newed effort to present the sum of three 
thousand dollars on their twenty-fifth 
anrnversary. 

Officers were chosen for the next five­ 
year period. The results are as follows: 
President, Everett Hallock; Vice Pres­ 
ident, W'illiam Schultz; Secretary, Alice 
Hackman; Treasurer, Edward Nolen; 
Chairman of the Class Gift Committee, 
Harold Weigel. 

The list of those present included 
John Cipko, Louis Gordon, Alice Hack­ 
man, Katherine Morris Hoy, Everett 
Hallock, Edward Kronenberg, Ray Lyon, 
Caroline Nolen, Edward Nolen, William 
Schultz and Mrs. Schultz, George Pat­ 
terson, Harold Weigel, Clarence Wel­ 
liver and Willis Willard. 

Joins Elmira Faculty 
Dr. Craig R. Thompson, '33, has been 

named associate professor of English at 
Elmira College, Elmira, N. Y. 

Before going to Elmira, he was in­ 
structor in English at Yale University, 
and previous to that served as instruc­ 
tor at Cornell University, 1937-1942. 
He was a Guggenheim Fellow for the 
year 1942. Dr. Thompson has his 
master's and doctor's degrees from 
Princeton University. 

He and Mrs. Thompson and their two 
sons, Allan and James, are now living 
at 437 West Clinton St., Elmira, N. Y. 
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Elect Three Alumni to Board of Trustees 
THREE alumni, George E. Lloyd, 

'01, '03L, William L. Eshelman, 
'15, and Sidney D. Kline, '24, '26L. 
were elected members of the Board of 
Trustees of the College at the annual 
meeting held at Commencement on 
Saturday, June 2. Messrs. Lloyd and 
Eshelman are also members of the Board 
of lncorporators of the Dickinson School 
of Law, and Mr. Lloyd is vice-president 
of that body. 

George Edgar Lloyd, who is vicc:­ 
president and trust officer of the Penn­ 
sylvania Company, Philadelphia, was 
born in Mechanicsburg and prepared for 
college at the Dickinson Preparatory 
School. He entered the College in 1897, 
graduated in 1901 with a Ph.B. degree, 
and received his A.M. in 1903 when he 
was graduated from the Dickinson 
School of Law with an LLB. degree. 
In the latter year he was admitted to 
the Bar and began to practice in Carlisle 

. and Mechanicsburg. From 1916 to 1920 
he was district attorney of Cumberland 
County. During his term in 1917 he 
became a director of the savings division 
of the Federal Reserve Bank, Philadel­ 
phia, and served until 1925. From 
1925 to 1927 he was trust officer of 
the Peoples Bank and Trust Company 
of Philadelphia, and from 1927 to 1930, 
trust officer of the Colonial Trust Com­ 
pany, Philadelphia. Since 1930 he has 
been trust officer of the Pennsylvania· 
Company, and later became vice-presi­ 
dent. He has conducted lecture courses 
on wills and trusts in the Dickinson 
School of Law, Temple University, and 
before the American Institute of Bank­ 
ing. 

Mr. Lloyd was married on June 12, 
1912, to Miriam S. Eberly, and for a 
number of years they made their home 
in Mechanicsburg. They now live in a 
country place along the Yell ow Breeches 
Creek. 

A member of Beta Theta Pi and Delta 
Chi fraternities, he is a Mason, an Elk, 

George E. Lloyd, '01, '03L 

a member of the Knights of Pythias, of 
the American and Pennsy-lvania Bar 
Associations, of the Art Club, Phila­ 
delphia, and of the Union League. 

William L. Eshelman, '15, is secretary 
and treasurer of the Industrial Hosiery 
Mills, Inc., manufacturers of men's half 
hose and ladies' full fashioned hose. 
The concern has mills at Mohnton, 
Lebanon and Shillington. He is the 
father of Lt. (j.g.) William R. Eshel­ 
man, '41, who is now stationed in Cuba. 

Mr. Eshelman was born at Mohnton 
November 12, 1891. He prepared for 
college at Perkiomen Seminary, and 
entered the College in 1911. In three 
of his four years at the College he was 
assistant to Prof. Guy H. Shadinger . in 
the chemistry laboratory, being sen1~r 
assistant his last two years. Upon his 
graduation from the College in 1915 he 
taught science for a year in the Narberth 
High School, and then. for two years 
in the L\tlantic City High School. In 
April, 1918, he became employed by 
the DuPont Powder Company, and re­ 
sumed teaching in the Atlantic City High 
School January 1, 1919, serving there 
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William L. Eshelman, '15 

until June, 1919, when he became asso­ 
ciated with the Industrial Hosiery Mills. 

Mr. Eshelman was active in the organ­ 
ization of the Dickinson Club of 
Reading, serving as president of that 
body. He is active in the affairs of 
the Calvary Evangelical Church, being 
financial secretary of the board. He is 
a m~mber of the Phi Kappa Sigma fra­ 
t~rntty, and is a Mason, including Con­ 
sistory and the Rajah Temple of the 
Shrine. He is also a member of the 
Wyomissing Club of Reading. 

Sidney DeLong Kline entered the 
banking field a year after his graduation 
from law school, and has risen progres­ 
sively to become president of the large 
and influential Berks County Trust Com­ 
pany of Reading. In 1927, the year be 
was admitted to the Bar, be became 
assistant to the vice-president and trust 
officer cf the Union Bank and Trust 
Company of Philadelphia. Two yea·rs 
later he went to Reading as trust officer 
of the Colonial Trust Company which 
later merged with the Berks County 
Trust Company, of which he is now 
the president. 

Born in West Reading on JL1ne 15, 
1902, he attended the Reading High 

Sidney D .. Kline, '24, '26L 

School, graduated from the College in 
1924, and from the Law School in 1926. 

On August 4, 1928, he married Leona 
C. Barkalow of the Class of 1927. They 
have a daughter and two sons. 

He is a member of the Reformed 
Church, of Phi Kappa Psi fraternity, 
the Wyomissing Club, and the Berks 
County Country Club. 

Wears D. F. C. and Air Medal 
Lt. Robert C. Taby, '38, veteran 

combat navigator, returned to this 
country in July and is now stationed at 
Ellington Field, Tex., wearing the Dis­ 
tinguished Flying Cross, the Air Medal 
with four Oak Leaf Clusters and the 
theater ribbon with two battle stars. He 
also wears the American Defense ribbon. 

Following his graduation from the ad­ 
vanced navigation school at Hondo, 
Tex., he went to England as a member 
of the 305th Bombardment Group of 
the 8th Air Force and participated in 
many operational missions in the 
European air war. 

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Joseph 
C. Taby, of Shamokin, Pa. His wife, 
Mrs. Juanita Taby, resides in Gateville, 
Texas. 



10 THE DICKINSON ALUMNUS 

Dies When Bomber Crashes in Kyushu Raid 
CAPT. John W. Long, j-. '41, was 

killed in action on August 9 when 
a bomber on which he was a crew 
member crashed while attacking a 
Japanese carrier at Kyushu. Capt. Long, 
who would have been 26 years old on 
August 17, entered the service July 16, 
1941, and was assigned to Ellington 
Field, Texas. He took cadet training in 
navigation on January 8, 1942, at 
Mather Field, Calif., and was commis­ 
sioned a second lieutenant on May 2, 
1942. 

After serving as an instructor of navi­ 
gation at Hondo Field, Tex., for 2% 
years, he trained for combat duty at the 
Columbia Army Air Base, Columbia, 
S. C., and went to the Pacific Theater 
of Operations on December 4, 1944. 

He was stationed at Lingayen Gulf 
as Squadron Navigator, and was later 
promoted to Group Navigator of the 
38th Bomber Group of the Fifth Air 
Corps. He won the Air Medal for 
meritorious service. 

A graduate of the East Hempfield 
High School, Class of 1937, Capt. Long 
graduated from the College in 1941. 
He was a member of Sigma Chi fra­ 
ternity, the College Glee Club, Mohler 
Scientific Club, International Relations 
Club, the German Club, and was as­ 
sistant manager of soccer. 

He is survived by his wife, the former 
Mary Louise Hollinger of Hollinger, 
Lancaster, R6, and two daughters, Judith 
Ann, two years, and Mary Louise, five 
weeks. Capt. Long had never seen the 
latter. He is also survived by his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. Warren Long, 
Manheim, RI, three sisters and a 
brother. 

Receives Her Doctorate 
Thelma M. Smith, '35, received he'r 

Ph.D. degree from the University of 
Pennsylvania on June 28. Her disserta­ 
tion was an edition of "The Uncollected 
Periodicals of James Russell Lowell." 

Capt. John W. Long, Jr., '41 

Joins Allied Control C~mmission 
Judge Fred S. Reese of the Cumber­ 

land County Courts, member of the 
Law School faculty, left last month for 
Germany to assist in setting up a govern· 
mg body under a section of the Allied 
Control Commission. He accepted a 
position in this work at the request of 
the War Department, with the simulated 
rank of colonel. He has since been 
made a brigadier general. 

During the absence of Judge Reese, 
Judge W. C. Sheely of Adams County, 
president of the Law School Board of 
Incorporators, will sit in the Cumberland 
County Courts. 

In Europe Judge Reese will assist in 
the establishment of a system of law 
regulating the work of the Public Health 
and Welfare Division in the Allied Con­ 
trol Commission which has jurisdiction 
over health control, welfare, religion and 
education. This group will be engaged 
m an effort to "De-Nazify the laws that 
regulate these four fields and to institute 
American procedures." 
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Dies in Airplane Crash in India 

A FTER 41 missions with the 10th 
Air Force as navigator. and bom­ 

bardier, 1st Lt. Theodore C. Strouse, '44, 
was killed in an airplane crash while 
traveling as a passenger over India on 
July Ll , 1945, according to word re­ 
ceived by his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clarion H. Strauser of 2133 Rudy St., 
Bellevue Park, Harrisburg. 

Following a long period of training 
as a navigator and bombardier, Lt. 
Strouse went to India in January of this 
year, and soon had completed 41 mis­ 
sions. He was awarded the Air Medal 
with one Oak Leaf cluster and the 
Bronze Star for his service in the Burma 
campaign. He was probably flying to 
a rest area when the crash occurred 
which caused his death. 

Born in Harrisburg on March 28, 
1922, he was a graduate of the John 
Harris High School and a member of 
Zion Lutheran Church of Harrisburg. 
He entered the College in 1940 and 
was in the last semester of his senior 
year when he enlisted in the Air Corps. 
During his undergraduate days he served 
as editor-in-chief of the Dickinsonian, 
was an officer of Phi Delta Theta fra­ 
ternity, and a member of Alpha Sigma 
Gamma. 

Following his cadet training in the 
Air Corps, he attended the Army school 
at San Marcus, Tex., where he received 
his commission and graduated as a navi­ 
gator on February 26, 1944. He was 
then sent to the bombardier school at 
Roswell, N. Mex., where he was gradu­ 
ated in June, 1944. Following that he 
trained in a B-25 medium bomber in 
which he flew during his 41 missions 
in Burma. 

Receives Army Promotion 
Lt. Colonel Thomas J. Frailey, '19L, 

of Chevy Chase, Md., who entered ac­ 
tive military service in World War II on 
June 16, 1941, with a General Staff 
assignment, has been promoted to the 

Lt. Theodore C. Strouse, '44 

grade of full colonel, effective June 15, 
1945. 

Following his graduation from Mt. 
St. Mary's College in 1915, Colonel 
Frailey entered Dickinson School of Law 
and received his LL.B. degree in 1919. 
He thereafter became a member of the 
Bars of Maryland and District of 
Columbia, and was later admitted to 
practice before the United States Su­ 
preme Court. 

He joined the law faculty of South­ 
eastern University in Washington, D. C., 
in 1919, and at the same time engaged 
in legal work with the United States 
Veterans Administration, Washington, 
D. C. He continued in these positions 
until 1941 when he was called to active 
military duty as a member of the Officers 
Reserve Corps, 

He joined the fraternity of Alpha Chi 
Rho in 1915, and became its national 
president in 1936. He is a member of 
the Board of Directors of the Farmers 
State Bank, Emmitsburg, Md. His serv­ 
ice in World War I was as a lieutenant 
of Infantry. He is past president of the 
Dickinson Club of Washington. 
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Four Dickinsonians Killed on Okinawa 

Cpl. John E. Martin, 111, '43 

F OUR Dickinsonians were killed and 
one was seriously wounded in the 

heavy fighting against the Japanese on 
Okinawa. Capt. Louis Reuter, Jr., '35, 
received a severe head wound. 

Cpl. John Edward Martin, III, '43, 
Lt. James H. Dieffenderfer, '44, Lt. 
Milton H. Fussell, III, '44, all of the 
Marine Corps, and Lt. John S. Smith, 
USNR, '2)L were killed in action there. 

Cpl. John Edward Martin, III 
While serving with Co. H, 3rd Bat­ 

talion, 29th Marine Regt., 6th Division, 
which Division was part of the 10th 
Army under General Buckner, who was 
later killed on Okinawa. Cpl. Martin 
was killed in action there on May 1). 
lt is believed that he was killed in the 
action before Naha at a place called 
Sugar Loaf Hill. 

When Jack finished his work at the 
College in 1943, he ~as already i.n a 
Marine camp when his class received 
their diplomas. His diploma was sent 
to his father, and, as he never had a 
long enough leave before going overseas 
to visit his home, he may be the only 
student graduated from the College who 

Lt. Je mes H. Dieffenderfer, '44 

never saw the diploma he had earned. 
His father, John E. Martin, '17, is 

himself a veteran of World War I. Jack 
was born in Philadelphia on June 26, 
1920, moving with his parents to Camp 
Hill in 1921. He graduated from the 
Camp Hill High School in 1938, played 
football for 3 years, and edited the first 
school year book published in that 
school. He was a member of the Camp 
Hill Presbyterian Church. Like his 
father he was a member of Beta Theta 
Pi fraternity. While in College he was 
a member of the football team, and 
played in a half-back position. 

He was awarded the Purple Heart and 
the Asiatic-Pacific medal. His parents 
have received word that he was buried 
in the cemetery on Okinawa. 

Lt. James H. Dieffenderfer 
2nd Lt. James H. Dieffenderfer, '44, 

was killed in action on Okinawa on 
May 2, according to word received by 
his father, Rev. John P. Dieffenderfer, 
2039 Baler Ave., Easton, Pa. 
Lt. Dieffenderfer was born in Easton 

March 16, 1923, and was graduated 
from the Wilson High School in 1941, 
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Lt. Milton H. Fussell, 111, '45 

where he played on the football team 
which won the league championship that 
year. Entering the College in the fall 
of 1941, he enlisted in the Marine Corps 
in 1942, and then was assigned to 
Franklin and Marshall College, where he 
completed his college course February 
29, 1944. He was a member of Phi 
Kappa Sigma fraternity. 

Following his training at Parris Island, 
S. C., he went to 0. C. S. at Camp Le 
Jeune, N. C., receiving his commission 
in October, 1944. Early last December 
he went overseas, and for a time was 
stationed at Guadalcanal, and then, as a 
member of the 1st Battalion, 1st Marine 
Division, took part in the invasion of 
Okinawa. 

Besides his father he is survived by 
two brothers in the service, Pfc. Daniel 
S. Dieffenderfer and Lt. (j.g.) Paul W. 
Dieffenderfer, USNR, and also by a 
brother, John F. Dieffenderfer, Audubon, 
N. J., and a sister, Mrs. Isabelle Miller, 
Nazareth, Pa. His mother died in 1927. 

Lt. Milton H. Fussell, III 
2nd Lt. Milton H. Fussell, III, '45, 

son of Mr. and Mrs. Milton H. Fussell 
of Swarthmore, Pa., was killed in action 

13 

Lt. John S. Smith, '25L 

on Okinawa on May 27, 1945, while 
serving with a Marine Corps unit. 

Born April 20, 1923, at Swarthmore, 
Pa., he prepared for College at the 
Swarthmore High School. He entered 
Dickinson in September, 1941, and be­ 
came a member of Phi Kappa Psi fra­ 
ternity. En~isting in the Marine Corps, 
he was assigned to the V-12 unit at 
Franklin and Marshall College on July 
1, 1943, and completed his course there 
in March, 1944. After his training at 
Parris Island, he attended 0. C. S. at 
Camp Le Jeune, and was commissioned 
on October 1. Shortly after last Christ­ 
mas he went to Guadalcanal and then 
to Okinawa. 

Lt. John S. Smith 
Lt. John S. Smith, USNR, ,'25L, 

former coach at Albright College and 
at the Reading High School, was killed 
on Okinawa on May 28. 

"Phog" Smith, who was a stellar 
athlete at Harrisburg Technical High 
School, was one of the best centers in 
the history of football at the College 
during the two years he was a student 
of the Law School. He was also an 
outstanding catcher in baseball. 
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Dies in Airplane Crash in Pacific 
WORD has just been received at the 

College reporting the death of 
Ensign Vincent Yarashes, '42, more than 
a year ago on July 10, 1944, in a plane 
crash in the Pacific theater of the war. 
It is believed that the crash occurred at 
Saipan. 

Ensign Y arashes was serving as a 
Naval aviator. He enlisted in the serv­ 
ice on Jdy 15, 1942, and received his 
commission October 20, 1943, at Corpus 
Christi, Tex. He received training at 
Sanford, Ill., before reporting at San 
Diego in January, 1944. 

Born on August 28, 1920, in Luzerne, 
he was the son of Michael and Anna 
R. Yarashes. He entered the College 
in September, 1938, upon his graduation 
from the Luzerne High School. He 
was a member of the Commons Club, 
of the track team, and. also of the foot­ 
ball squad. 
In addition to his parents, he is sur­ 

vived by a sister, Miss Catharine 
Yarashes, of 325 Vaughn St., Luzerne, 
Pa. 

Colgate Promotes Kerr 
Andrew Kerr, 1900, has been pro­ 

moted to an associate professorship in 
physical education at Colgate University. 
He has been assistant professor since 
he came to Colgate as head football 
coach in 1929. 

Following gr a d u a t i o n, Mr. Kerr 
taught and coached in Johnstown, Pa., 
and Pittsburgh high schools; coached 
football, track and basketball at the 
University of Pittsburgh from 1914- 
1922; footoall and basketball at Stan­ 
ford University from 1922-1926; and 
football and basketball at Washington 
and Jefferson College from 1926-1929. 
Mr. Kerr has coached the All East Team 
in the East West Shrine Game in San 
Francisco since 1927, and coached Col­ 
gate's unbeaten, untied, unscored upon 
football team of 1932. 

Ensign Vincent Yarashes, '42 

Wounded On Okinawa 
Captain Louis Reuter, Jr., '35, re­ 

ceived a severe head wound in the fight­ 
ing on Okinawa on May 13 whe'.1 .s~rv­ 
ing with the 96th Infantry D1V1s10n. 
He is now a patient in the McGuire 
General Hospital, Richmond, Va. 

Captain Reuter was shot by a Japanese 
sniper at very close range. The bullet 
went through his helmet and stopped 
in his brain. The bullet was removed 
on the battlefield where he fell, and 
after the operation he was removed to 
a field hospital. He lay unconscious for 
several days, and at first there was little 
hope for his recovery. When he re­ 
gained semi-consciousness, he was evacu­ 
ated from the island. 

On August 27 an operation was per­ 
formed on his brain at the McGuire 
General Hospital, with his sister, who 
is an Army nurse stationed at the hos­ 
pital, assisting in the operation 
He has been awarded the Silver Star, 

an Oak Lea.f cluster, and the Purple 
Heart medal. 
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Killed By German Sniper Shortly Before V-E Day 

PFC. ROBERT S. GRISSINGER, 19 
year old member of the Class of 

1947, was killed by a sniper at Heil­ 
brom, Germany, on April 7, 1945. On 
April 25 his parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
M. Grissinger of York Springs, Pa., re­ 
ceived a telegram saying that he was 
missing in action since April 7, and on 
June 8 they received word that he had 
been killed in action on that day. Later 
they received a letter from a chaplain 
telling them that Robert had been killed 
by a sniper while fixing his radio while 
serving with an advance patrol. 

Inducted into the service on January 
24, 1944, while in his first year at the 
College, he was with the ASTP until 
it was discontinued, and then received 
infantry training. He went overseas in 
October, and a month later, on No­ 
vember 19, 1944, was wounded in action 
for which he received the Purple Heart. 
Shortly after Christmas he returned to 
his unit, Co. G., 397th Infantry of the 
lOOth Division. A second Purple Heart 
w.as awarded posthumously and sent to 
his parents. 

Born in Harrisburg, October 25, 
1925, his family later moved to R. D. 1, 
York Springs, and he graduated from 
the Dillsburg High <School with honors .. 
He became a member of the Theta Chi 
fraternity, and was a pre-medical student 
at the College when he was inducted 
mto the service. 

Besides his parents he is survived 
by a twin brother, John M. Grissinger, 
jr., PhM3/c, and his maternal grand­ 
parents. His parents have received word 
that he was buried in a U. S. military 
cemetery in western Germany. 

Former Coach Killed 
Frank Grnbe, former assistant football 

coach at Dickinson College, died on 
July 2 in New York City from bullet 
wounds apparently inflicted by mistake. 

Pfc. Robert S. Grissinger, '47 

Police said Grube walked into a fusilade 
of revolver shots when he investigated a 
noise in the hallway of the apartment 
house in which he lived. 

An All American football star at 
Lafayette College, he was catcher for 
the Chicago White Sox in 1931, and 
was later with the St. Louis Browns. 
He was forty years of age. 

Loses Leg on Luzon 
Sgt. Richard M. House, '46, after 

serving in the invasion of Leyte, was 
hit in the right leg with a 20 mm. anti­ 
aircraft shell on February 8 during the 
invasion of Luzon. His leg had· to be 
amputated between the knee and the hip, 
and he has been confined to a hospital 
ever since. He was brought back to 
this country and is now a patient in 
Ward 3E, McGuire General Hospital, 
Richmond, Va. 

Sgt. House was serving as an Army 
paratrooper when he was wounded. He 
was struck when he was running across 
Nocholas Air Field on Luzon, carrying 
a large radio. He had gone overseas in 
April, 1944. 
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Marine Corps Colonel Receives the D. F. C. 
THE Distinguished Flying Cross was 

presented in June to Marine Lieu­ 
tenant Colonel John P. Haines, Jr., ·3;, 
of Middletown, Ohio, by Major General 
Clause A. Larkin, Commanding General 
Marine Fleet Air, West Coast, at the 
Marine Corps Air Depot, Miramar, 
Calif. 

Commanding officer of a fighter 
squadron based in the Marshall Islands, 
Colonel Haines scored direct hits on an 
important anti-aircraft fire control sta­ 
tion. · He was cited by Chester W. 
Nimitz, Fleet Admiral, for "his pioneer­ 
ing spirit, supurb leadership and daunt­ 
less courage in keeping with the highest 
traditions of the United States Naval 
Service." 

Recently returned, he is an assistant 
operations officer on General Larkin' s 
staff, stationed at Naval Air Station, 
North Isfand, Calif. 

Colonel Haines received his wings and 
commission at Pensacola, Fla., in De­ 
cember, 1938. He was promoted to his 
present rank in December, 1944, while 
based in the Marshalls, ·His colleagues 
will remember him 'best as "Pete" 
Haines, and as a member of Beta Theta 
Pi fraternity. 

His wife, the former Pendery V. 
Spear, and their two sons, live at 1220 
Lind St., Middletown. He is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Haines, 902 
Greenway Ave., Morrisville, Pa. 

Wounded in Action 
Pfc. James E Donegan, Jr., '45, w_as 

wounded in .action on February 24 while 
serving with the 376th Infantry Regi­ 
ment of the 94th Division which was 
in combat 211 consecutive days. He 
spent three months in hospitals in 
Germany, France, and England before 
returninz to his unit in May. He is 
now in b Germany with Co. H., 376th 
Inf., APO 94, c/o Postmaster, New 
York. 

Lieutenant Colonel Jolin P. Haines, Jr.1 137 recelvlnq 
the D.F.C. from Maior General Clause A. Larkin 

Awarded Bronze Star Medal 
For heroism displayed in action 

against the Japanese at San Jose, Luzon, 
P. I., Capt. Lyman G. Hertzler, '39, of 
Carlisle, has been awarded the Bronze 
Star Medal by the commanding general 
of the 6th Infantry Division in Luzon. 
When an attacking rifle company re­ 

ceived direct fire from two anti-tank 
guns to its front, it was forced to halt 
and take cover. Hertzler, in command 
of the company, then personally led two 
tanks into position from which he di­ 
rected fire on the guns. Despite intense 
enemy fire which scored a direct hit on 
one of the tanks, he remained at his 
post, directing fire until both guns had 
been destroyed. 

Hertzler is now plans and training 
officer of a battalion of the 63rd Infantry 
Regiment of the "Red Star" 6th. Infantry 
Division. 
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Returns Home Wearing Distinguished Flying Cross 

F IRST Lieutenant William L. Pate_r­ 
son, '43, returned to his home in 

Clearfield in August on a leave after 
service as the co-pilot on the B-17 Fly­ 
ing Fortress. "Chesty II," wearing the 
Distinguished Flying Cross. His father 
is Robert Bruce Paterson, '13. 

The award was "conferred upon him 
for "extraordinary achievement, cool 
courage and devotion to duty" during 
the Eighth Air Force borrrbing attacks 
on military and industrial {arg_ets 
throughout Germany and Nazi occupied 
Europe. He has also received two Presi­ 
dential citations holds the Air Medal 
with eight Oak' Leaf clusters, and com­ 
pleted thirty-four missions. 

As a member of the 34th Bomb 
Group Lt. Paterson is a veteran of many 
heavy bombardment missions over enemy 
territory. One of his Presidential cita­ 
tions was conferred upon his divisi;:m 
for its now historic England-Africa 
shuttle bombing of Messerscnmitt plants 
at Regensburg, Germany. 
. His roughest mission was directed on 
industrial installations at Brussels, 
Belgium. On that mission he had a 
close cal! when the flak was very in­ 
tense and a piece of flak came to a 
stop directly under the seat of his plane. 

Many will remember him as the player 
of the Scottish bagpipes, for he brought 
one of them to College, and frequently 
appeared on the campus in his ·kilts. 
During a visit to Edinburgh, Scotland, 
~e had the pleasure of hearing and play­ 
rng with the Scotts champion piper, a 
member of the famous Black Watch 
Regiment. 

Lt. Paterson is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert B. Paterson of 411 E. 
Locust St., Clearfield, Pa. He gradu­ 
ated from the College in January, 1943, 
and entered the Army Air Force the 
following April. At the College he 
became a member of Phi Delta Theta 
fraternity. 

Lieutenant William l. Paterson, '43 

Cited For Bravery 
Capt. David A. Streger, '39, has been 

awarded the Silver Star for exceptional 
service under fire. He lead a spearhead 
task force of infantry and tanks in ·the 
drive up the west coast of Italy to cap­ 
ture Genoa last April. The 130-mile, 
three-week drive had many bitter 
engagements, during which Captain 
Streger served as a rifle company com­ 
mander. 

"Capt. Streger' s gallant and heroic 
action," the citation reads, "put an end 
to the stalled. attack, restored the high 
morale of our troops, and pioneered a 
way for expediting our whole flow of 
supplies." 

Resigns From Faculty 
Dr. Bernice K. Grubb, who has been 

an instructor in the Department of 
Romance Language for the past three 
years, and director of the Women's Glee 
Club last year, resigned at the annual 
meeting of the Board of Trustees in 
June. She had accepted appointment as 
an associate professor at Thiel College. 
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Sinks Five Ships of Jap Convoy in One Night 
THE most amazing feat of sinking 

in one night an enemy convoy of 
five ships off the coast of Formosa is 
one of the high spots in the brilliant 
record of Lt. (j .g.) J. E. Kennedy, '42, 
who came to his home in Carlisle on 
leave in July after a strenuous tour 
of duty in the Pacific during which he 
flew 116 missions as a Patrol Plan Co­ 
Pilot. Last month he was assigned to 
the Banana River, Florida, Naval Air 
Training Station as an instructor. 

Wearing the Distinguished Flying 
Cross and the Air Medal with a Star 
in lieu of the Second Air Medal, Jack 
and his crew have been accredited with 
sinking 20,000 tons of Japanese ship­ 
ping off the coastlines of both Formosa 
and China. They also rescued two fliers 
from the open sea and evacuated seven­ 
teen wounded American soldiers and 
Filipino guerillas. 

He was recommended for these 
awards after flying 41 missions, among 
them anti-shipping strikes, patrols, sec­ 
tor searches, and air-sea rescue missions 
in the face of enemy action and in 
constant danger from enemy fighters and 
anti-aircraft fire. 

The plane in which Lt. Kennedy flew 
is one of the Navy's twin-engined patrol 
seaplanes, the famous "PBM" or Martin 
"Mariner." In a crew of twelve, his 
duties as co-pilot and navigator con­ 
sisted of both flying the plane and keep­ 
ing track of the plane's course and 
position. 

He flew a total of 760 hours in the 
Mariner and saw action with his 
squadron at Saipan, in the Bonin Group, 
at Ulithi Atoll, and Paulau and the 
Philippines. While in the Mariannas, he 
met Coach Arthur D. Kahler. 

The story of the sinking of the five 
ships in an enemy co.nvoy. off the coast 
of Formosa in one nighr rs one of the 
unusual tales of the war. His plane 
was patrolling from the Philippines 
toward Formosa and was "black catting" 

Lt. (j.g.) J. E. Kennedy, '42 

at night. This means that the plane h.ad 
been painted black to make it as. m­ 
visible as possible in the dark of rnght, 
and also that the plane was flying at 
an altitude of only 250 feet a great 
part of the time. The plane's radar 
picked up something nearby and a few 
minutes later, the lookout called that it 
was a ship. Believing that the vessel 
was alone, all the bombs on the plane 
were dropped, and the tail-gunner peer­ 
ing through the darkness reported that 
he thought it was a "near miss." 

Another call from the lookout an­ 
nounced there was another ship ah.ead 
and Lt. Kennedy sent his plane into 
the proper course to fire the 50 caliber 
machine guns at the new target. The 
salvo hardly struck the second vessel 
when it burst into flame lighting the 
sea for miles and revealing the th~ee 
other ships in the Jap convoy. With 
the sea aflame these vessels became easy 
targets though both opened their anti­ 
aircraft batteries. When the fourth was 
sent to the bottom, Lt. Kennedy turned 
his plane back to see what had happened 
to the first ship, and found that instead 
of fl "near miss" its stern was pointed 
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heavenward as it plunged into the 
depths of the sea. It was estimated 
that this convoy totalled 17,000 tons. 

Jack, who is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Cash Kennedy, 551 Highland Ave., 
Carlisle, is a graduate of the Carlisle 

High School and he graduated from the 
College in 1942. He is a member of 
Kappa Sigma Fraternity and was on the 
Microcosm staff while an undergraduate 
and he was a member of the German 
Club. 

Establishes Scholarship in Memory of His Wife 

B Y A GIFT of $5,000, the Ruth 
Sellers Maxwell Scholarships in 

English Literature were established in 
August by Mrs. Maxwell's husband, 
Robert H. Maxwell, of Carlisle. 

Mr. Maxwell presented the gift in 
memory of his wife, who, for many 
years, was a teacher in English Litera­ 
ture, and who died last March 7. Mrs. 
Maxwell graduated from the College 
1Il 1915, and her husband was a class­ 
mate. 

The $5,000 gift creates a scholarship 
fund, the income from which will be 
used for three scholarships to be pre­ 
sented each year to students of the 
College at the annual commencement 
exercises. One of these will be of $50, 
and will be presented to the member of 
the sopohornore class with the highest 
standing in the sophomore course in 
English Literature. Two other scholar­ 
ships of $100 each will be awarded, one 
to a member of the junior class, and 
the other to a member of the senior 
class, each with the highest scholastic 
standing in the advanced English courses 
of their respective classes. 

Mrs. Maxwell was a daughter of the 
late Elmer <E. and Annie Ernst Sellers 
of Carlisle, and a graduate of the 
Carlisle High School. Following her 
~raduation from the College she taught 
1Il the Carlisle High School, and then 
for a number of years in the Lemoyne 
High School. On February 11 of this 
year she fell on an icy sidewalk while. 
walking to church and suffered a frac­ 
ture of her, right leg. Just a few days 
before she was schedLtkd to leave the 

hospital for her home, she died sud­ 
denly on March 7 of an embolism. 

Mr. Maxwell, who formerly was as­ 
sociated with a public utility company 
in Pottstown,. has been employed during 
the war period at the Mechanicsburg 
Naval Supply Depot. 

Two Missing in Action 
Lt. James M. Loenshal, '45, of the 

. Army Air Corps, has been listed as mis­ 
sing in action since February 7. Up to 
August 29, his mother, Mrs. Myrtle O. 
Loenshal, of 311 Allegheny St., Holli­ 
daysburg, Pa., had not had any further 
word about her son. 

Pvt. F. Thorley Hollinger, '47, of the 
l 12th Infantry Regiment, was listed as 
missing in action December 20 in Lux­ 
embourg. In April his father, Franklin 
T. Hollinger, of 426 S. High St., Mech­ 
anicsburg, received word that his son 
was being held a prisoner of war by 
the Germans. Since then no further 
word has ~rriv~d, though his parents 
have made mqu1ry through the Adjutant 
General's Department and the Red 
Cross. 

Receives Air Medal 
Lt. Glenn M. Smith, '43, has received 

the Air Medal with four Oak Leaf 
clusters. He received the award for his 
servic~ with one of ~he bomb groups of 
the Eighth Army Air Force which was 
based in England. He completed 35 mis­ 
sions over Germany. 
He returned to his home in W aynes­ 

boro, Pa., in June, for a 30-day leave 
before reporting to Miami Beach for; 
m1~signment, . 
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EDITORIAL J 
A New Women's Dorm 

D OUBTLESS the co-ed alumni will send up the first cheer in learni_ng that t~e 
Trustees of the College are planning to erect a new women's dormitory ~n ~ e 

Mooreland Campus as soon as practicable. That there is a need for this bmldmg has long been admitted. 
Older alumni will recall Lloyd Hall, ·the early days which followed at Metzger 

and then in the rece_nt years the additior, of the Parker House, the Gibbs Ho~e 
and now two fraternity houses. Smee the days of the presidency of Dr. James · 
Morgan when Metzger was acquired for college use, that building has served the 
college well. Many alterations were moide within and a few years ago the fronJ 
of the building lost its old porch, the covering vines and clustered shrubbery an 
was adorned with a new stairway. Today, it is doubtless a better dormitory than when the College first moved in. 

Like everything else in a modern world, however, women's dormitories must 
provide facilities today which were not the mode not long ago. Today, there 
should be a number of living rooms rather than a parlor. The dining hall whether 
in the dorm or in another building should be a fine room. Today, there has to be 
a Jot more plumbing to provide lavatories and baths, with a number of showers. 
Well ventilated, well lighted, well heated bedrooms should have built in closets 
and lots of storage space. To provide these and other musts, the Trustees have 
decided that the best way to do it is to erect a new limestone building on the 
Mooreland Campus. It will probably mean a $250,000 undertaking but it wiH. be 
one which will merit the help and support of every alumnus, and a fine addition 
"to a campus adorned by Old West, the Alumni GymnJsium and the Bosler Library. 

More Lasting Than Granite 
0 N OTHER pages and in other recent college publications, there have been 

reports of many enduring gifts to the college. At Commencement, the Class 
of 1915 presented a $2,500 addition to the permanent endowment fund to create 
a scholarship and thus joined the procession of classes whose numerals will forever 
appear in the catalogues and _fii:ancial rep?rts. More recently, two alumni have 
established endowed funds as livmg memona]s to their wives. Robert H. Maxwell, 
by a gift of $5,000, has created .the Ruth Sellers Maxwell Schiolarships in Engli~h 
Literature, and Raymond B. Whitmoyer has created the M. Helen Lehman Whit- 
moyer Fund for scholarship ~rants. . . . 

Many alumni have sent rn contnbut1ons to the Paul Herbert Doney Memorial 
Fund, which is and will ~e used .through the years for the purchase of books for 
the library. Recently, a Chicago friend o~ the College, Mr. William B. Greenlee, has 
made a special gift for ~ks ~or t?e ltb~ary. 

These are all endurmg gifts rn which every donor has rejoiced, and they 
set a worthy example for many to follow. In these days when memorials are 
being considered everywhere by so many, there can be no better suggestion that 
a gift to the endowed funds of the College creates a meroorial more lasting than 
granite. 
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Presents Library Fund For Collection of Books MR. WILLIAM B. GREENLEE, of 
Chicago, recently presented a gift 

of $500 for the purchase of a collection 
of books for the college library on 
nleogr~phy, printing, library history and 

1 e subjects. Mr. Greenlee is an author 
an~ a trustee of the Newiberry Library, 
Chicago. 
fii Though born with the instincts of an 
istorian, !'-fr. Greenlee prepared him­ 

self for his inherited responsibilities as 
the only son of a pioneer manufachuer 
of Chicago by pursuing a technical 
course at college. He attended Beloit 
and was graduated from Cornell with 
the B.S. degree in 1895. 

After a long and successful business 
career, Mr. Greenlee retired in 1927 and 
has since devoted himself to the studies 
for :Vhich he had long been preparing 
in his leisure hours. His special interest 
is the Portugese discoveries of the 15th 
a.nd 16th centuries. His first contribu­ 
tion in this field a volume on Cabral, 
the discoverer oc' Brazil, was published 
by the Hakluyt Society of London and 
has be~n accepted as the definitive work 
~n this subject among Brazilian and 
ortugesc scholars as well as those in 

Britain and America. He is now at 
work on a similar study of Vespucci. 

. ti:e has also written a descriptive 
bib~1ography of the history of Portugal 
wh!Ch. was published in "The Hispanic 
American Historical Review," August, 
1940; and an article on the first century 
of _Brazilian history in Mid-America, 
~pnl, 1943, besides various book re­ 
views and notes. 

During his business career, Mr. 
Greenlee was secretary of Greenlee Bros. 
and Co., Rockford, Ill., manufacturers 
of machinery and tools from 1896 to 
1902 when he became president of the 
firm. He was also president and 
treasurer of the Northwestern Stove Re­ 
pair Company and president of the 
No:thwestern Foundry .Company, of 
which he is now chairman of the board. 

A trustee of Newberry, he is also a 

1 
l 

Fellow of the Royal Geographical 
Society and of the American Geograph­ 
ical Society. He is a member of the 
American Institute of Metallurgical 
Engineers, the American Historical As­ 
sociation, the British Institute of Philos­ 
ophy, the Hakluyt Society and the Geo­ 
graphical Society of Chicago. A member 
of Sigma Chi Fraternity, his clubs are 
University, Cliff Dwellers, Caxton Sad­ 
dle and Cycle. He is married and has 
a son and two daughters. 

Wins Many Awards 
During his two tours overseas Lt. 

James H. Yeingst, '43, of the Army Air 
Corps, has been awarded two battle stars, 
the Air Medal with five clusters, two 
Distinguished Unit Citations, and is en­ 
titled to wear the ETO ribbon, the South 
Pacific ribbon, the American theater rib­ 
bon, and the Pre-Pearl Harbor ribbon. 
He returned to the States in April, and 
in July was assigned to Williams Field, 
Ariz., to train men to serve in the Pacific. 

Entering the Army in October, 1941, 
he served 13 months in the South Pacific 
returning to the States to enter the cadet 
training program in May, 1943. He re­ 
ceived his commission as a navigator at 
Selman Field, La., in January, 1944, and 
then spent eleven months rn the 
European theater. 

His parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ross J. 
Yeingst, and his wife, Mrs. Ethyleen 
Yeingst, and his small son reside in 
Mt. Holly Springs. 

A Marked Man in Science 
Dr. Paul R. Burkholder, '24, was one 

of the young scientists starred in the re­ 
cent seventh edition of American Men 
of Science. This publication place's a 
star after the names of men who have 
done outstanding work in some scientific 
field, and _is the authoritative listing of 
men of science. Dr. Burkholder is pro­ 
fessor of botany at Yale University. 
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Tell Story of Nazi Reign of Terror in Poland 
T3E eye-witness chronicle of ter­ 

rorized Poland during the Nazi oc­ 
cupation is told in full and exact detail 
by Gaither and Hania Warfield in "Call 
Us to Witness" ($3.00), published June 
15 by the Ziff-·Davis Publishing Com­ 
pany. 

Dr. Warfield, who graduated from the 
College in 1917, and Mrs. Warfield ex­ 
pose in their journal of violence the 
daily horrors committed by the Nazis in 
their plan for the scientific eradication 
o.f every living Pole in occupied ter­ 
nton~s. Husba1'.d and wife take up the 
tale 111 alternatmg chapters, a device 
which not only makes for diversity of 
incident, since Gaither is carried into 
Russia along with a wave of captured 
Polish refugees and, later Hania and 
Gaither's venturesome Journeys take 
them into different parts of Poland and 
e.ven into Berlin, but also serves to high­ 
light the contrasting natures of two ex­ 
trem.ely interestii;g and likeable people. 
Hania is proud, mtuitive, somewhat hot­ 
tempered, . generous and almost unbeliev­ 
ably fearless. Her husband is cautious, 
shrewd, ingenious, self-sacrificing, cool­ 
headed. 

Startling chapters reveal the fiendish 
persecution by the Nazis at Pawiak 
prison . in the Warsaw ghetto, the 
Oswiecim crematory, Konopnica, Joze­ 
fow, Ostrow Mazowiecki, Zielonka, 
Bochina and the 90-odd other slaughter 
houses of Poland. . 

"Call Us to Witness" is not alone a 
warning against the dangers of com­ 
placency and self-interest. It is also an 
affirmation of the strength of United 
Nations forces-a profession of faith, 
courage, and love for one's fellow man. 
It is a sensitive book, extremely moving 
-but factual. It is an account of ex­ 
citing, unexpected-and, often, horrify­ 
ing-happenings of daily city and 
country life under German oppression. 
It gives initimate glimpses of Gestapo 
headquarters. It reveals the steadfast 

Rev. Gaither P. Warfield, D.D., '17 

courage and heroi~ resis~ance of a. people 
whose spirit was indornitahle. hi 
The W"rfields have wntten an IS­ 

" . · what the torical document-for here is h 
Germans did to iPoland, and how t e 
Polish people retaliated. . 

4 Dr. Warfield went to Poland .m 192 
as a missionary of the Methodist Epis­ 
copal Church, South. . H~ prepared f~ 
foreign service at Dickinson Colle.g ' 
Drew Theological Seminary, and Union 
Theological Seminary. When war ~roke 
out on September 1, 1939, he was living 
in Warsaw. 
He organized the American Colony 

and was eventually arrested by the 
Gestapo in December, 1941, and put 
in Pawiak prison in Warsaw. Later, 
he was interned at Laufen, Bavaria, w~th 
other Americans. His Polish-born wife 
and daughter, Monica, who was born !n 
1935, were kept under constant surveil- 
lance by the Gestapo. . 

Hania Warfield was born m Lwow, 
Poland She attended the Conservatory 
of Music there and was educated in 
Brussels, at Oxford and Cambridge. She 
speaks Polish; Engli'sh, French, and 
German. She married Dr. Warfield in 
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1928, and they worked together in 
Warsaw. 
rwo years later, they came to America 

an spent most of the following eighteen 
month · s in New York City. She became 

W
a naturalized citizen. In 1931 the 

arfi I ' ' e as returned to Poland to carry 
on their work. 
U ~hey were finally repatriated to the 
nited States as exchange prisoners and 

:re at present on an extensive lecture 
four to raise twenty-five million dollars 
or relief and rehabilitation outside the 
scope of UNRRA. ' 
N Their present residence is at 110 
orth Bentz Avenue, Frederick, Md. 

Becomes Full Professor 
Dr. John W. McConnell, '29, became 

professor of sociology at New York 
University on September 1. He had 
been associate professor of sociology 
there. 

For the past few years Prof. McCon- 
nell has been serving as a public mem­ 
ber of the National War Labor Board, 
Region II, of the New York area. 

During the same period, he has been 
a part-time research associate at the In­ 
stitute of Human Relations at Yale 
University, where he has been engaged 
on a research project in industrial re- 
lations. 

Organize Dickinson Club of Chicago 
WITH 28 present, the Dickinson 

I Club of Chicago was organized on 
Ju Y 6 at a dinner held at the Merchants 
~nd Manufacturers Clu:b. The group had 
een called together by an organization 
~om~1ttee consisting of Dr. Pierce But­ 
Ser, 06, Dr. Blair S. Latshaw, '09, and 

1 
amuel W. Witwer, Jr., '30. Dr. But­ 
~r presided as toastmaster, and Dr. Lat- 
s aw offered the invocation. 
~r. Witwer, who practices law in 

Jhicago, was elected as the first presi­ 
ent of the club, and Dr. Butler was 

~ected vice-president. Mrs. William G. 
ray, the former Mary Rombach, '27, 

was elected secretary-treasurer. These 
offi · R cers, with Arthur H. Carver, '02, the 
ev. Stanley B. Crosland, Jr., '21, and 

Dr. Latshaw, will form the executive 
committee. 

It was voted that dinner meetings be 
held at least once a year on the call of 
t?e officers of the club. By formal ac­ 
tion the club sent greetings to President 
C. William Prettyman who was pre­ 
vented by illness from attending the 
meeting. 

Dean Josephine B. Meredith, who in 
July. :vas visiting her daughter, Mrs. 
Christina Vestling, '34, at Urbana, Ill., 
attended the dinner. Mrs. Meredith and 
Gilbert Malcolm, alumni secretary, were 

the representatives from the College and 
the speakers. Informal talks were made 
by various alumni present. 

There was one unusual incident at the 
dinner when William C. Phares, '11, 
sat at the table and saw the Rev. Stanley 
Crosland present. Probably because 10 
years had separated these men at col­ 
lege, it was not until the dinner that Mr. 
Ph~res, a Frequent visit~r at the Congre­ 
gat10nal Church m Chicago, discovered 
that the man he went to hear preach was 
Stanley Crosland of the Class of 1921. 

Those who attended the organization 
meeting were as follows: David K. Mc­ 
Millam, '02, and his two daughters, Mrs. 
Doerr and Mrs. Hedgebach; Arthur H. 
Carver, '02, and Mrs. Carver; Dr. Pierce 
Butler, '06 and Mrs. Butler; William B. 
L. Drawbaugh, '07, and Mrs. Draw­ 
baugh; Dr. Blair S. Latshaw, '09 and 
Mrs. Latshaw; William C. Phares, '11 
and Mrs. Phares; Dr. Forrest E. Adams 
'11; Dr. Karl K. Quimby, '11; Rev. E'. 
L. Geissinger, '14 and Mrs. Geissinger; 
John W. Garrett, Jr., '19; Rev. Stanley 
B. Crosland, '21; Paul C. Behanna '27 · 
Mrs. Mary Rombach Gray, '27 and Mr'. 
Gray; William M. Shaeffer, '27 and Mrs. 
Shaeffer; Samuel W. Witwer, Jr., '30 
and Mrs. Witwer; Dean Josephine B. 
Meredith and Gilbert Malcolm. 
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Walks 500 Miles After Escape From Prison Camp 
Two months after his plane had been 

shot down over Slovakia, T /Sgt. 
Charles Walter Benner, Jr., '44, was one 
of 32 soldiers who escaped from a 
German prison camp and walked 500 
miles to arrive safely in Italy two months 
later. He has returned home wearing 
the Distinguished Flying Cross, an Air 
Medal with five clusters, the Purple 
Heart, the Bronze Star, and a Distin­ 
guished Unit Badge. He will reenter 
the College as a student next month. 

Serving with the 4S4th Bomb Group, 
which was based near Foggia, Italy, 
T/Sgt. Benner was a turret gunner on 
a B-24 Liberator bomber. He had made 
a number of missions when, on July 7, 
1944, his plane 'was sent to Odertal, 
an oil target between Vienna and 
Breslau, As the plane approached the 
target it was hit by flak, and again by 
flak after leaving the target Shortly 
afterward the bomber was attacked bv 
eleven fighters and the gun crews were 
able to shoot down five of them. How­ 
ever, their own ship had been badly 
hit, an<l it was necessary for the crew 
to bail out. One of their number had 
already been killed, and the nine other 
members of the crew had all been hit. 
T /Sgt. Benner was wounded in both of 
his legs, but parachuted safely to the 
ground, landing about thirty miles north­ 
east of Bratislavia in Slovakia, where 
he was taken prisoner by the Germans. 
He was held there until September 2 
when he was one of thirty-two who 
succeeded in escaping, traveling by foot, 
sometimes by day and sometimes by 
night, and staying in peasant homes or 
receiving help from underground 
sources. The group reached Italy safely 
in November. T /Sgt. Benner was then 
flown back to the United States, and 
for more than six months was a patient 
in the Fort Thomas Convalescent Hos­ 
pital in Kentucky. For _a time he taught 
English in the hospital school for 
wounded veterans, and was finally dis­ 
charged from the Army on August 23. 

T/Sgt. Charles Walter Benner, Jr., '44 
receiving his D.F.C. 

All ten members of T /Sgt. Benners 
crew received the Distinguished Flym~ 
Cross, one of them being awarde 
posthumously. The citation reads_ as 
follows: "For extraordinary achi~ve­ 
ment while participating in aerial flitfh: 
in the Mediterranean and North Afnc 
Theater of Operations. Showing a high 
order of courage, leadership and pro­ 
fessional skill, these gallant air crew 
members have distinguished themselves 
throughout many Jong and hazardous 
combat missions against the enemy 
despite severe and adverse weather con­ 
ditions and enemy opposition by large 
numbers of aircraft and intense, ac­ 
CLrrate, and heavy antiaircraft fire. Dis­ 
playing great combat spirit and aggres­ 
siveness, these men have met, engaged, 
and defeated the enemy regardless o~ the 
odds and in spite of the fact that at times 
their planes were so severely damaged 
that only by extraordinary skill an_d 
fortitude were they able to fight their 
way through to the objective and aid in 
the grave damage inflicted upon the 
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enemy. By their heroism skill and air- 
man hi ' ' ~ ip, as shown throughout their 
~om at careers, together with their in­ 
~nse devotion to duty during this period 
0 rntense combat op. erations against the 
enemy th l · h ' iese men have upheld the 
t~g est traditions of the military service, 
thereby ·reflecting great credit upon 
U emselves and the Armed Forces of the 
nited States of America." 

MT /Sgt. Benner is the son of Mr. and 
A rs. C. Walter Benner of 20 Ashmire 
T ve., Trenton, N. J. He was born in 
renton on February 18 1922 gradu- 

ated f ' ' Scho rom the Trenton Central High 
th ol in 1940,. and was a student at 
A e College until his enlistment in the 
E trfCorps. He is a member of S. A. 

· raternity. 

Heads Naval Unit 
Lt. John G. Cornwell, USNR, '21, 

who f V ori:ierly commanded the Navy 
S -rz unit at the University of the 
outh, Sewanee Tenn became com- 
~anding officer' of th~ unit at Case 
~ho?l of Applied Science, :~levelan~, 

., . rn July. At the same time he is 
ser_vmg as commanding officer of the 
unit at Western Reserve Medical School. 
th At Se~anee, Lt. Cornwell headed 
S ree units at the University of the 
outh, and the V-12 units at the School 
of Medicine, Vanderbilt University and 
at the School of Religion at Vanderbilt. 

) 
Report Hooshmand Dead 

C A :eport originating in a letter from 
aptain Louis Reuter, Jr., '35, which is 

unconfirmed, is that Falhoullah Hoosh­ 
mand, '38, Persian who was a student of 
the College in 1935, may have been ex­ 
ecuted. 
In a letter written by Captain Reuter 

on April 9, when he was serving with 
the 38lst Infantry at Camp White, Ore­ 
gon, he says, "Today for the first time 
i met an officer who knew a Dickin­ 
sonian that I once knew. The man in 
question is the Persian, Hooshmand. I 

am told that Hooshmand received his 
doctorate from the University of Pitts­ 
burgh and was recalled to his homeland 
by way of the Pacific. Some alarm is 
felt for him since no word has been re­ 
ceived in a year and a half, plus the 
fact that about seventy-five other Persian 
students were executed when they 
reached their homes because of 'pink 
tendencies' ". 

Will Be Unopposed 
Judge W. C. Sheely, incumbent, re­ 

ceived the nomination of both Demo­ 
cratic and Republican voters for Com­ 
mon Pleas Judge of Adams and Fulton 
Counties at the June Pennsylvania pri­ 
mary, and will be unopposed at the 
general election. Judge Sheely is presi­ 
dent of the Board of Incorporators of 
the Dickinson School of Law. 

Attends Inauguration 
Dean E. A. Vuilleumier represented 

the College at the inauguration of Dr. 
Herbert L. Spencer, eighth president of 
Bucknell University on June 23. Dr. 
Spencer was formerly president of the 
Pennsylvania College for Women at 
Pittsburgh. --------- 

What Ails the Church? 
The· Rev. Alson J. Smith, '30, pastor 

of St. Paul's Methodist Church in 
Brooklyn, N. Y., is the author of an 
article, ' What Ails the Church?" pub­ 
lished in the August, 1945, number of 
American Mercury. He has written for 
magazines on a wide range of religious, 
political and economic subjects. 

His article deals with what he con­ 
siders "the three worst blights of the 
Christian Church." He names these as: 
(1) the pitiful and all-too-apparent gap 
between the church's profession and its 
practice; ( 2) Protestantism's emphasis 
on conduct rather than on motive· and 
( 3) C~tholicism' s constitutional in~bility 
to resist the temptation to temporal 
power. 
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Whit Bell Becomes Associate Prof. of History 
AFTER several narrow escapes from 

death or serious injury, Lt. Whit­ 
field J. Bell, Jr., '3 5, former instructor 
of the department of history and asso­ 
ciate editor of THE DICKINSON 
ALUMNUS, returned to his home last 
month after two years in Italy and 
Germany with the American Field Serv­ 
ice. He has been appointed associate 
professor of history at the College, and 
will begin his work with the opening 
of the fall term on October 8. 

Rejected by the Army and Navy, and 
by Selective Service, -he volunteered as 
an ambulance driver and was assigned 
first to duty in Africa. He then served 
throughout the campaign in Italy during 
which he was mostly assigned to the 
British front. He was on duty through­ 
out the whole battle for Cassino during 
which he had many close calls. On one 
occasion he was stunned by an exploding 
shell, knocked to the ground while walk­ 
ing away from his ambulance, and for 
two weeks the left side of his face was 
paralyzed. With the cessation of war­ 
fare in Italy, he went to Germany when 
he was commissioned and was stationed 
at the Belsen concentration camp. 

He is now completing work on his 
thesis which will qualify him for his 
doctorate from the University of Penn­ 
sylvania. Just before his return, the 
May 1945 issue of the Bulletin of the 
History of Medicine printed an article 
he had written, "Suggestions for Re­ 
search in the Local History of Medicine 
rn the United States." 

First to Land on Japan 
Lt. (j.g.) Benjamin D. James, USNR, 

'34, former member of the faculty and 
football coach, was one of the first 
Americans to land in Tokyo and served 
as the only Beachmaster in his area when 
the troops went ashore on August 30. 
It is believed that another faculty mem­ 
ber, Capt. Roy R. Kuebler, '33, of Army 
Ordnance, landed at the same time or 
shortly afterward. 

Whitfield J. Bell, Jr., '35 

Lt. James is serving on the USS 
Garrard, an attack transport, which had 
been preparing for the invasion of Japan 
when V-J Day changed its future tasks. 
As Beachmaster for the occupation, he 
attended all the conferences with the 
generals and admirals before the landing 
and was the onlv officer of his ship's 
company with official sanction to go 
ashore. 

In a letter to his wife written August 
30, Ben wrote 'Today was a memorable 
day, we landed in Tokyo Bay. I was a 
13eachmaster on one of the beaches and 
was one of the first to land on Japan 1 

We were underway early this morning 
and as soon as we anchored in the bay 
we and the troops went into the beach 
in our LCV.P boats. There were a few 
[ap officials there but there was no shoot­ 
ing. As the day went on we landed 
many troops and much cargo. These 
troops will patrol the area and eventually 
the whole country will be occupied. 
These are the first to go ashore. We 
landed and took over the largest airfield 
in this vicinity. I was able to pick up 
a Jap helmet and a megaphone, which I 

(Continued on page 34) 
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l PERSONALS 

1891 

St 
The R,ev. Harry B. Stock, DD t f p 

1 
. ., pas or o 

49 au s Lutheran Church of Carlisle for 

J 
years, announced to his congregation in 

une- th Su d at he would resign on the first 
th; ~~ rn .June, 1946, which will mark 
past rnpletion of 50 years of service as 

or, 
1893 

pr Robert Emmet MacAlarney was elected 
se es.ident of the Society of Silurians at the 
N mi-annual dinner and reunion held at the 

0 
ew .York Athletic Club on May 19. The 

0~ganrzation 
describes itself "an association 

h young men who 25 or more years ago 
ono d ' ' by :e .r..: the newspapers of New York City 

t . 01 king thereon as reporters editors, car- 
oonrsts or illustrators." ' 

1897 
Gi:;trs .. E .. E. Gill, wife of Dr. Eugene E. 
Gill' died. in Tampa, Fla., on July 11. Dr. 

C l 
has smce moved to a suburb of Denver, 

o o t Ii - G'I[ ., o rve with his daughter, Mrs. Grace s: t Harmon. His new address is: 4515 S. 
n a Fe Drive, R. D. 2, Littleton, Colo, 

1900 
tl Rev. Francis R. Bayley D.D. retired from 
le Baltimore Conferenc~ in June after 45 

years of · f · I ad . . contmuous success ul service. n 
wdtt10n to pastorates, the last of which was 
B 1 son Memorial Church, Baltimore, Dr . 
. ayley has had two terms as district super­ 
mifndent, Dr. Bayley' s native heath is Mill­ 
~1 e, N. ]., the same as that of Bishop 
0fson, '17 .. Dr. Bayley will often be seen in 

pu pits during his retirement as the field 
fepresentative of the Allied Asbury Homes 
Sor Cthe Aged of the Baltimore Conference. w-1 _arrnll Coale, '08, has succeeded him at 

1 son Memorial Church. 
1901 

In June F. T. Woodward, former general 
patent attorney of the Western Electric Com­ 
f~ny, became consulting patent attorney of 
Me Company, a part of the Bell System. 

0/· 

Woodward entered the patent department 

1 
Western Electric m 1908. From 1911 to 
:24 he headed the Company's patent depart- 
ent in Europe. He became assistant gen­ 

eral patent attorney in 1924 and was ad­ 
vanced to general patent att~rney in 193 7. 

190,2 
Mrs. Ethelyn H. Cleaver has been elected 

to honorary membership in the Eugene Field 

Society, a national association of authors and 
journalists. Col. William A. Ganoe, who served as 
chief of the Historical Section of the Euro­ 
pean War Theater, expects to retire this 
month after 43 years' service in the Army on 
physical disability in the line of duty. He 
returned to this country in August, and has 
been stationed at the Army hospital a Ft. 
Devens, Mass., convalescing after a physical 
breakdown. 

1903 
After 29 years as chairman of the depart­ 

ment of history and social science in the high 
school at Asbury Park, N. J. Fred E. Malick 
has resig.n~d in order to retire from teaching. 
Mr. Malick was a guest of honor at a special 
luncheon given by the faculty of the high 
school at the Marine Grill on the boardwalk 
on June 14. 1906 

Dr. and Mrs. Roy H. Dunkelberger sailed 
in June from Los Angeles to return to India 
for missionary work there under the Lutheran 
Church. Dr. Dunkelberger has been serving 
as pastor of the Lutheran Church at Myers- 
dale, Pa. 
Dr. Lynn H. Harris has become 

professor of English at Southeastern 
State College. His new address 
Illinois Ave., Cape Girardeau, Mo. 
Philip S. Moyer, attorney of Harrisburg, 

Pa., and Mrs. Moyer were painfully injured 
in an automobile accident in July on the 
Gettysburg Pike. They are still nursing some 
of their bnuses, but both have recovered. 

associate 
Missouri 
is: 816 

1907 
Miss Catharine Ann Rich, who was for­ 

merly on the administrative staff of the Col­ 
lege, daughter of Congressman and Mrs. 
Robert F. Rich, was married on July 21 to 
Cpl. Roswell Brayton upon his return from 
the European theater of war. The ceremony 
took place in the Emmanuel Church, Boston, 
and was followed by a rec .ption at the 
Copley Plaza Hotel. 

1908 
Two sons of Rev. Elbert M. Conover have 

been wounded and decorated while in the 
armed services. Ensign Paul H. Conover who 
has. been in command of a Navy crew' on a 
freighter, received the Order of the Purple 
Heart, having . been wounded while under 
bombardment JO a European harbor Pfc 
Theodore Conover wears the Purple. Heart 
and Cluster and Combat Medal with three 
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Bronze Stars. He was wounded three times, 
the last during the attack on Cologne when 
two bullets pierced his left shoulder and a 
third broke his left arm. 
Rev. George Henry Ketterer, D.D., was 

granted the retired relation at the spring ses­ 
sion of the Central Pennsylvania Conference 
after his pastorate at Hollidaysburg. Dr. and 
Mrs. Ketterer are now living at their old 
home at Warrior's Mark, Pa. 
Dr. B. F. Chappelle of the department of 

modern languages at the University of Nevada 
was the official representative of Dickinson 
College, the University of Pennsylvania, and 
the American Association for the Advance­ 
ment of Science at the inauguration of Dr. 
John 0. Moseley as president of the Univer­ 
sity of Nevada in June. 

Rev. Allen C. Shue, who was pasto1' of the 
First Methodist Church at Tyrone, has been 
transferred to York, Pa., where his address is 
1202 E. King St. 

1909 
After residing in Michigan for a number 

of years, Ellsworth H. Mish has a new 
address: 255 Linden St., Rochester, N. Y. 

1910 
After a number of years on the faculty of 

Horace Mann School, Arthur J. Latham en­ 
tered the retired list of Teachers College as 
of June 30, 1945. 
Judge Karl E. Richards of the Dauphin 

County Courts is convalescing at his home in 
Harrisburg after· a long siege as a patient in 
the Harrisburg Hospitaf, · during which he 
underwent several operations. 

1911 
Henry Elmore Smith, member of the fac­ 

ulty and superintendent of grounds and build­ 
ings of the College, was married on August 
12 to Mrs. Eleanor Wootten Hemsley in St. 
Paul's Episcopal Church, Ball:imore, Md. 
Mrs. Smith is a graduate of Maryland Insti­ 
tute, Baltimore. 

1912 
Rev. Harry Evaul, D.D., for some time 

pastor of Epworth Church, Washington, D. 
C., has been assigned to Memorial Methodist 
Church in Hyattsville, Md., where his address 
is: 5000 42d Ave. 

David A. Henderson, who is with the Mu­ 
tual Coal Company, GaJlup, N. Mex., became 
a Lifer in June. . 

George L. ("Skeet") Gordon, who, in 
1940, was one of the sponsors of an ex~en­ 
sive employee sports pro-?ram, and who, sm~e 
1943, has served as chairman of the athletic 
advisory committee of Lukens Steel Company 
and its subsidiaries, By-Products Steel Corp. 
and Lukenweld, Inc., of Coatesvi lla, retired 
as of August 15 to devote his entire time to 

tbe Combined Sales Department of the '.hred 
concerns with which he has been associate 
for some time. 

1913 
James H. Hargis won the Republican nom: 

ination at the June Pennsylvania primary for 
the office of burgess of Carlisle. f h 
W. Alexander McCune, member o t .e 

faculty of the William Penn High School, is 
convalescing at his home after a serious op­ 
eration in August. He will pro~a~ly need ~~ 
undergo a second operation within a sho time. 

1914 
Rev. Frank Y. Jaggers is stationed at Do~­ 

las Memorial Church, Washmgton, D. h'. 
with residence at 808 11th St., N. W., Was 

1 ington 2, after many years in the successfu 
pastorate at the Anacostia Methodist Churc~. 

After his service on the Dover District, t e 
Rev. Walter A. Hearn, D.D., has been ap­ 
pointed pastor of the Methodist Church, El~­ 
ton, Md., where his address is: 229 E. Maif 
St. His neighbo~ there is Edwin S. Dorcus 0 
the Class of 1912. . d 
Dr. Fred L. Mohler returned to the .Umte f 

States on June 24 after a long period 0 
service overseas, and is again employed by 
the Bureau of Standards. He now spends a 
good bit of his time at Oak Ridge, Tenn:, 
where the atomic bomb was made, as a sci­ 
entific consultant to Army engineers. 

1915 
Rev. R. Watson Sadler was transferred from 

Mt. Airy, Md., to the Methodist Churc.h. rn 
Brunswick, Md., in June, and is now living 
at 725 Park Ave. 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold S. Fasick have moved 

fro!"l West Barrington, R. I., to 986 Memorial 
Dnve, Apt. 605, Cambridge, Mass. 

1918 
Chaplain Herbert K. Robinson, who has 

been promoted to the rank of captain in the 
Army, is chief chaplain of the 127th General 
Hospital at Nancy, France, APO 513, Cfo 
Postmaster, New York City. 

1919 
Mrs. Esther Pope! Shaw was the speaker 

at the annual reception of the Girl Reserves 
given by the Phyllis Wheatley Branch Ill 
Harrisburg on May 21. 

1920 
Paul W. Pritchard is temporarily in Wash­ 

!ngton, writing a war history for the Chem­ 
ical Warfare Service. 

1921 
Mr. and Mrs. William· M. Young of Har­ 

ri~burg announced the birth of a son, William 
M. Young, Jr., on March 6, 1945. 
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W Mrs. Sarah A. Walker 77, mother of Paul 
latalk~, bdied June 7, o~ the birthday of her 
hoe ~s and, Christopher Walker, at her 
"me m Bolivar, Pa Before her marriage 
ivirs W lk · ' teach ~ er, nee Sarah A. Reynolds, was a 
To erh. m the schools of West Wheatfield 

wns ip, 
1922 

A.Lt. Col., George Hurst Paul of the Army 
Bu Corps is serving with the ETO Manpower 
oard in Paris. 

111John 
_L. Bitner of Enola, Pa., and Mrs. 

m argu~nte R. Stein of Baltimore, Md., were 
R:d~~e a~ the Episcopal Church of the 

mer m Baltimore on June 23. For the 
t~s~bl2 years Mr. Bitner, a member of the 
le 

1 
erland County Bar, has been on the ol~ staff of the Farm Credit Administration 

Bell altimore. The couple now reside at 104 
emore Road, The Orchards. 

1923 
W Capt. Harry B. Mullan, Marine veteran of 
aftorld War I, returned to his home in July 
Me~ three years of active service with the 
Iw~m~s .in World War II. During service at 
f Jima he was awarded the Bronze Star 
or meritorious service. Upon his return he 
was app . t d di ' d ti om e coor inator of veterans e uca- 
Fln for Polk County with offices at Bartow, 
a. 

Lt Ager more than two years in the Navy, 

l
·n· . onald H. Goodyear was placed on the 
act1 ·· · posit"ve l1s_t m June, and has resumed his 

pan/on with the G. R. Kinney Shoe Com- 

192<\ 
C John D. Yeagley of the Army Medical 
J ?rps was promoted to the rank of colonel in 
. une. For 10 years before entering the serv­ 
iceC he was a practicing physician in York. 
. apt. C. M. Wallace of the Medical Corps 
is now assigned to 1075 AAFBU Hotel Pan- 
coast, Miami Beach, Fla. ' 

1925 
.Jhohn W. Weise is serving as a chaplain 

Wit the Navy. He has been on the USS 
Sperry in the Pacific. 

1926 
. The former Dr. Leslie ]. Schwalm is serv­ 
mgd as a lieutenant commander in the Navy, 
an has been with U. S. Naval Mobile Hos­ t~u} No. 9, Fleet Post Office, San Francisco, 

Henry ]. Sommer, Jr., is a lieutenant 
gilonel, and is with the Judge Advocate's 
epartment of 28th Infantry Division Head­ 

quarters. 
1927 

Maj. William R. Thompson, former attor- 

ney of \1\T aynesburg, has served during the 
war with the Intelligence Branch of the 
Army Air Forces. 

Lt. Francis Willoughby is in the psychiatric 
division of the Naval Medical Corps stationed 
at Bethesda, Md. 

1929 
Cpl. John McCrea of Newville, member of 

the Cumberland County Bar, returned home 
in June for a 30-day furlough. He then 
returned to McGuire General Hospital, Rich­ 
mond, Va., to receive treatment for back in­ 
juries suffered in an accident last December 
while he was serving in Italy. 

Having received his discharge from the 
Army where he served as a major, Dr. Charles 
F. Hoban, Jr., is now living at 630 Harper 
Ave., Drexel Hill, Pa. 

1930 
Rev. Everett F. Hallock, pastor of the 

Methodist Church at Rutherford, N. J., is 
chairman of the Conference Relations and 
Ministerial Qualification Committee, and in 
June was elected president of the Conference 
Board of Education for the quadrennium. His 
church recently raised $28,000 during a finan­ 
cial campaign for $25,000, and this effort 
will clear off the mortgage while the church 
is also paying its share to the Conference 
Pension Fund Drive. 

1931 
Miss Mary Kathryn Herb, daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. Earl J. Herb of Halifax, and 
William McCrea, Jr., of Newville were mar­ 
ried on July 3 at the home of the bride's 
parents. Mrs. McCrea is a graduate of Hood 
College and taught in the Newville High 
School. Mr. McCrea, who is a veteran of 
World War II, is associated in the practice 
of law with his brother, John McCrea, '29 
who is now in the armed service. ' 

Lt. Col. Donald S. Himes, who had been 
statiol).ed at the Quartermaster 'School, Camp 
Lee, Va., has gone overseas, and his address 
is: 84th Q.M.C., APO 84, c/o Postmaster, 
New York City. 

1932 
]. Wesley Oler has become associated with 

the legal firm of Morgan, Lewis & Brockius 
with offices in the Fidelity-Philadelphia Trust 
Building, Philadelphia. 

. C. T. Straw, mailman,_ '.hird class, is sta­ 
ti~Jiled at t~e Naval Receiving Station, Guam. 
Smee enterrng the service in April, 1944, he 
has served m the Fleet Post Offices at New 
York, Boston, San Francisco and Pearl 
Harbor. 

Robert A. \l?'aidner has been promoted to 
th_e grade of lieutenant colonel in the Arm 
Air Force. y 
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R. Donald Ness has been promoted to the 
grade of full lieutenant in the Navy, and his 
present address is 14 Johnson Ave., West 
Caldwell, N. J. 
Lt. (j.g.) Edward E. Johnson, USNR, who 

had been on the Atlantic with the Armed 
Guard, was discharged on August 10 to be at 
the bedside of his son, Richard. The 61/z­ 
year-old lad was critically burned in a grass 
fire near his home on Good Friday, and 
lingered for five months, but died on August 
25 sbortlv after his father's return from the 
service. The boy was wearing a cowboy play 
suit which was ignited by the fire and he 
suffered severe body burns which apparently 
also caused internal injuries, resulting in his 
death. 

1933 
Martin G. Hildenberger, father of Assist­ 

ant United States District Attorney Joseph G. 
Hildenberger, died at bis home in Bethlehem 
on May 5. Two other sons survive, Captain 
Martin J. Hildenberger and Staff Sergeant 
Francis T. Hildenberger, as well as his widow 
and six daughters. He was a member of the 
insurance firm of Hildenberger and Green, a 
director of the Bethlehem National Bank, and 
former official reporter of the Northampton 
County Court at Easton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard F. Holman, Jr., of 
809 Linden Avenue, Wilmette, Ill., an­ 
nounced the birth of a daughter, Gertrude 
Louise, on April 14. Mrs. Holman is the 
former Polly Barnhart. 

Capt. Roy R. Kuebler is now at Pearl 
Harbor after going through the Okinawa 
campaign. 

Thomas L. Brooks has been promoted to 
the rank of major while serving with the 
Chinese Combat Command as liaison officer 
and instructor of Chinese troops. 

1934 
Capt. John W. Bieri of the Army Medical 

Corps was first stationed in Ireland with an 
evacuation hospital in the earlier days of the 
war, but for some time has been at a base 
hospital in France. 

Pfc. Lester T. Etter, who bas been a pa­ 
tient in the Deshon General Hospital at 
Butler, is steadily improving, and has been 
transferred to the convalescent hospital at 
New Castle. 

1935 
Edward C. First, jr., was inducted into the 

Army on June 11 and sent to Camp Lee, Va., 
for his basic training. 

Lt. Donald K. Mcintyre, Army Medical 
Corps, left Carlisle last December, spent a 
month in California, one in Texas, one in 
France, and then went to Germany. 

1936 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman C. Wittfoot of 

Dalton, Pa., have announced the marriage of 
their daughter, Elizabeth Mathilda, to Robert 
Lair Donaldson, a chief specialist in the U. S. 
Navy, on June 9. 
John A. Novack, who is serving with a 

G-2 section in Germany, was promoted to the 
rank of first lieutenant. 

Lee W. Raffeosperger, teacher of physics 
and algebra and assistant coach in the Car­ 
lisle High School, resigned in July to accept 
a permanent position with C. H: Maslaod and 
Sons. 

Mr. and Mrs. John M Crevelrng have 
moved from Upper Darby to 919 Bell Ave., 
Yeadon, Pa. 

On August 1, W. D. Gordon was trans­ 
ferred by the Pennsy lvaoia Railroad from 
Boston to Nashville, Tenn., as district freight 
agent. Waxy's new address is: 1003 Stahlman 
Bldg., Nashville 3, Tenn. 

Lt. Col. Paul V. Kiehl has been named 
surgeon of Headquarters Command in Ger­ 
many, U. S. Group CC, APO 742, c/o Post­ 
master, New York City. 

Philip F. Detweiler was discharged from 
the Army in July after service in Bermuda 
and India. He has accepted a position in the 
claims division of the legal department of the 
New Amsterdam Casualty Insurance Com­ 
pany, and is stationed at the Pittsburgh office. 

Sgt. Kenneth B. Kines has gone overseas, 
and his address now is: Hq, & Hqs. Det., 
7lst Ord. Group, Hqs. Assembly Area Com­ 
mand, APO 758, c/o Postmaster New York 
Ci~ , 

1937 

John P_ Haines has been promoted to the 
rank of lieutenant colonel in the Marine 
Corps, and is stationed at San Diego. 
More than two years after his death, the 

parents of Lt. John E. Dale, Jr., received 
word that their son had been posthumously 
awarded the Purple Heart, and delivery of 
the award was made to them. 

Miss Alyce Charlton Hickey, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. James Monroe Charlton, San 
Antonio, Tex., and Capt. Newton Webster 
Hersbner, Jr., were married on June 27 in 
the Army Chapel at Page Field, Fort Myers, 
Fla. Mrs. Hershner graduated from Texas 
State College for Women in Texas. Capt. 
Hershner is a graduate of the University of 
Maryland Medical School, and served a year's 
internship in the Harrisburg Hospital prior to 
entering the service. He is a graduate of the 
Army's School of Aviation Medicine at Ran­ 
dolph Field, Tex. 

Capt. Arthur A. Mangan, who was pro­ 
moted to his present rank in April, returned 
home in June after nearly two years' service 
as a meteorologist with the Anny Air Corps 
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in England and Scotland. He visited the 
College and became a Lifer. 
Fred V. McDonnell, who was an examiner 

with the Pennsylvania State Banking Depart­ 
;ncnt for nearly three years, resigned in June 

1~ 
become secertary-treasurer of the Carlisle 

.ust Company. 
Harold E. Hench has been promoted to the 
rnk of major according to word received in 
une, He was then serving in Germany. 

J Capt. Miles D. Garber was graduated on 
J\~.-~e· 2 

0 

from the Army's School of Military 
.. ' ropsychiatry hrId at Mason General Hos­ 
,.rtal, Brentwood, N. Y. Dr. Garber has 
cerved one year as an infirmary suraeon and 
two years as ward officer in the ne;ropsychi­ 
~try section, Camp Pickett Convalescent Hos­ 
pital, Va. 
A second son, Alexander Ormond Boulton, 

~as born on July 4 to Capt. and Mrs. Richard 
. · Boulton, at Savannah, Ga. Capt. Boulton 
rs now serving with guerrilla troops in north­ 
ern Luzon, Philippine Islands. 

Lt. (j .g.) Richard A. Rosenberry has been 
assigned to the Staff, Command Air Support 
~fntrol Units, Amphibious Forces Pacific, 
eet Pos: Office, San Francisco, Calif. While 

returning to the States in August, one of his 
passengers before his present assignment was 
Ray Shore, '38, who was returning for a 30- 
d_ay leave, after completing many combat mis­ 
sions as navigator of a B-24. 

1938 
Lt. George William Barnitz, Jr., Air Corps, 

and Capt. Francis Gulden, Medical Depart­ 
~ent, grew up together as kids in Boiling 
prrngs. They had not seen each other for 

several years when they met unexpectedly in 
khe lobby of a luxurious Adriatic Sea hotel. 
oth happened to have been assigned to the 

same hotel for quarters. · 
Lt. John D. Rively is communications offi­ 

cer of the USS Hope, one of the Navy's new­ 
est _and fastest hospital ships operating in the 
Pacific. 

Capt. Vance A. Criswell is on duty with 
the Armed Forces Institute, APO 75, c/o 
Postmaster, San Francisco, Calif. 

Lt. Lawrence M. Brown has returned to 
the United States after 35 missions over Ger­ 
man occupied territory. He wears the Air 
Medal with five clusters and the E.'f.0. with 
five battle stars. Serving as a B-17 pilot with 
a . heavy bombardment group in the Eighth 
Arr Force, he participated in bombing raids 
over Paris, Berlin and Leipzig as well as. in 
support of ground troops in the breakthrough 
at St. Lo, Failais and during the Ardennes 
campaign. 
Dr. Nathan A. Targan entered the Army 

Medical Corps in 1942 and received an hon­ 
orable discharge in December, 1943, when he 
entered King's County Hospital, New York, 

as an intern. From May, 1944, to July of 
this year, he held a residency at Bellevue 
Hospital, New York City. He is now engaged 
in the practice of medicine in Atlantic City. 
Dr. and Mrs. Targan announced the birth of 
a daughter, Carole, in May. 

Lt. C. Joseph Foulds has returned from 
service in the Pacific, and is now stationed at 
the Marine Barracks, Naval Air Station, 
Patuxent River, Md. 

Pfc. Howard J. Loos is in Czechoslovakia 
and is acting as an interpreter at a prisoner 
of war camp. Rev. Louis E. Young has been appo•inted 
by Bishop J. Bromley Oxnam to become co­ 
pastor with Rev. George Y. Flint, of the 
Methodist Church at Morristown, N. J. He 
and his wife,• the former Jean A. Lappley, 
'39, have moved to 28 High St., Morristown, 
N. J. Henry Remsburg has been promoted to the 
rank of lieutenant, junior grade, while serving 
as a .communications officer on a destroyer in 
the Pacific. Lt. John L. Scott returned to Carlisle in 
July for a 30-day leave, after 26 months' sea 
duty in the Pacific. 

Lt. (j.g.) Nancy Bacon flew to Hawaii on 
July 16, and is now stationed at the U. S. 
Naval Hospital, Base 8, Navy 128, Fleet 
Post Office, San Francisco. 
After serving as the ranking non-com of a 

postal unit, Albert F. Barbush was commis­ 
sioned a second lieutenant on June 9, and is 
now postal officer at Headquarters, Seventh 
Army, APO 758, <:./o Postmaster, New York 
City. Capt. Fred J. Charley, who was stationed 
in Greensboro, N. C., now has for his address 
Base QM, APO 841, c/o Postmaster, New 
Orleans, La. 

1939 
Virgini,1 Dodge Auburn, daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. Charles J. Auburn of New York 
City, was married on June 23 to Lt. Gordon 
Farquhar Robertson, USNR Medical Corps. 
Lt. Robertson is an alumnus of the Groton 
School, Harvard University, and the Col­ 
lege of Physicians and Surgeons, Colum­ 
bia University. He served in the Mediterra­ 
nean theater for 16 months and participated 
in the invasions of Italy and France. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ressler Arthur Dusseau of 
Washington, ·D. C., announced the birth of a 
daughter, Ann, on February 26. Mrs. Dusseau 
is the former Audra Ahl. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert A. Craig of Coates- 
ville announced the birth of a daughter, 
Nancy Lynn, on August 13. Mrs. Craig is the 
former Evelyn Clark. 

_Chaplain Ja_mes W. Lewis, USNR, is chap­ 
] am of the Lighthouse Reservation of the U. 
S. Coast Guard at Chatham, Mass. 
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Chaplain George E. Thomas is aboard the 
USS Appalachian, A.G.C.I., c/» Fleet Post 
Office, San Francisco, Calif. 

1940 
William F. Depp, RT3/c, is serving in the 

Naval Research Laboratory in Washington, D. C. 
Walter S. Williams has been promoted to 

the grade of technical sergeant, and be is 
serving as sergeant major of a bomber squad­ 
ron in the Pacific. 
Lt. W. Elmer Thomas has completed a tour 

of shore duty as a flight instructor in Florida, 
and returned to duty in the Pacific theater. 
Mail will reach him in care of his father, 
Rev. Earl R. Tlhomas, 126 N. George St., 
Millersville, Pa. 

Dr. George H. Jones, Jr., upon the com­ 
petion of his internship at Geisinger Hospital, 
Danville, entered active service in the Army 
and was assigned to a course at the Carlisle 
Barracks. 

Lt. John Gruenberg, II, who had been sta­ 
tioned at Camp Claiborne, La., has been 
assigned to the headquarters of the Alaskan 
Department, APO 942, c/o Postmaster, Seattle, 
Wash. 
Kenneth Tyson has been promoted to the 

rank of first lieutenant. 
1941 

William Dean Fencil is serving as a Naval 
noncom::nissioned officer in the Pacific war 
zone. 

First Lt. Irvin A. Garfinkel bas been 
selected to attend the Field Artillery Pilots' 
course at Fort Sill, Okla. 
Charles W. Karns was promoted to the 

rank o.f full lieutenant in the Navy on May 1. 
Lt. (j.g.) William B. Kerfoot is aboard the 

USS Gilbert Islands, an aircraft earner some­ 
where in the South Pacific. 

Lt. and Mrs. Willis C. Marlatt .announced 
the birth of a son, George Raring Marlatt on 
June 20. Mrs. Marlatt is the former Jane 
Raring. 
Lt. John B. Carroll, twice wounded while 

serving 21 months in Europe, came home for 
a 30-day leave in July. He was wounded the 
second time at Duren, Germany, rn De~em­ 
ber after which he spent two months in a 
hospital in England. He is with the First 
Army which is being redeployed. . . 

Carl H. T. Sieg, after serving with an anti­ 
aircraft unit attended officers' candidate 
school in France, and was commissioned a 
second lieutenant on April 27. Since the end 
of the war he has been in various towns of 
Germany and for a while acted as mayor of 
Calenberg and is now in Salzbach. 
Lt. Samuel J. McCartney, Jr., who. became 

a full lieutenant early in August, visited the 
College last month upon his return from 

service with the amphib10u~ forces in Britain. 
Durmg the Normandy invasion he com­ 
manded an LST. 
Dr. Karl R. Beutner is on the staff of 

Worcester Hahnemann Hospital, Worcester, 
Mass. 

1942 

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Leroy Freas of 
Upper Darby announced the marriage of then 
daughter, Ursula Elaine, to Lt. George B. 
Faller on Thursday, April 26, in Honolulu. 
The wedding took place in the post chapel 
there. Lt. ]. A. Harter, a cassmate of the 
bridegroom at the Dickinson Law School, was 
one of the guests. Lt. Faller graduated from 
Georgetown University in 1940 and from. the 
D1ckmson Law School in 1942. He rs a 
member of the Pennsylvania Bar, and bad 
been oversea, for more than 18 months at 
the time of his wedding. . 

Ensign ]. Frank Gayman became a life 
member in June. He has been serving in the 
Pacific as a co-pilot on one of the new Na"Y, 
land based bombers called the "Privateer. 
He hopes to return home some time in November. 

Russell R. Tyson, Jr., received his M.D. 
degree upon his graduation from Jefferson 
Medical College in June. At the commence­ 
ment exercises he was awarded two prizes, 
the obstetrics prize and the neurology prize. 
He is now an interne at the Bethlehem Hos­ pital. 
Thomas H. Barnes, Jr., has been promoted 

to_ the rank of sergeant in the Marine Corps 
with which he is serving in the Pacific area. 

Col. and Mrs. Wilson Lewis Townsend of 
Kensington, Md., announced the marriage of 
their daughter, Elizabeth Gayley, to Lt. Hor­ 
ace Lincoln Jacobs, III, on June 27. H. L. 
Jacobs, Jr., '13, served as best man for his 
son, and Austin Grugan, .USNR, '43, was an usher. 
Lt. Harry W. Speidel has been assigned to 

the C~ntral School for Navigation at Elli;ig­ 
ton Freid, Tex. A navigator with the First 
Troop Carrier Command over the China­ 
Burma-India theater, he received the Air 
Medal, the Distinguished Unit Badge and a battle star. 
William Steckel, who had been serving as 

deputy clerk in the Middle District Court, 
was appointed law clerk by Judge Albert L. 
Watson of the Federal Court in July. 
Mr. and Mrs. E. Soltau Nailor of Mechan­ 

icsburg have announced the marriage of their 
daughter, Nancy, to Dr. Horace H. Long on 
May 30. Mrs. Long has been teaching for 
the past three years in the Mechanicsburg 
High School. Dr. Long graduated from 
Get~ysbur15_ with Phi Beta Kappa honors, and 
recerved hrs degree in medicine at the U01- 
versity of Pennsylvania. Pr. and Mrs. Long 
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now reside at 141 E. Main St., Mechanics­ 
burg. 
_Donald H. Morse is a technical sergeant 

~1th a_ signal intelligence unit operating in 
e Middle Pacific theater. Lt. Stanley D. 

Adler, Jr., '45, is in the same unit. 

1 
William M. Burns, laboratory chief of the 

,Jth Fighter Command photo section in the 
est Philippines, has been promoted to staff 

~ergeant. Overseas since April, 1943, Sgt. 
urns 1 s c_harged with the responsibility of 

photographing and processing pictures deal- 

F
mg with the activities of the Jungle Air Force 
ighter Command. 

1943 
!'Lt. (i.g.) and Mrs. Robert Wesley. Rad­ 
~iffe of 5510 Pamlico Circle, Norview 

0/1ghts, 
Norfolk, Va., . announced the birth 

22 
a son, Harry Quentin Radcliffe, on May 

p i Mrs. Radcliffe is the former Evelyn Alice 

1 
a ler. Lt. Radcliffe is serving in the Chap­ 

.... ~msf Corps at the Navy Training Station in 
"or olk. 

Lt. Palmer S. McGee, Jr., was one of the 
graduates in the June class from the U. S. 
Military Academy; West Point, when he re­ 
~eived his commission and was assigned to 
uty at Ft. Benning, Ga. 
John T. Pfeiffer, III who is serving with 

the Air Corps in China, has been promoted 
to the rank of captain. 
John R. Emlet received his M.D. degree 

upon his graduation from Duke Medical 
School in June, and is now serving his intern­ 
ship in the Duke Hospital, Durham,. N. C. 

. Lt. Stanley G. Wilson, Jr., of the Army 
Air Corps was married on July 16 to Miss 
Gladys June Dobbs of Springfield, Mass., in 
the Base Chapel at McGowan Field, Idaho. 

Lt. (j.g.) D. Dudley Bloom, USNR, since 
November, 1944, has been commanding offi­ 
cer _of a Naval supply ship operating in_ tl~e 
Pacific theater of war. His vessel, a unit in 
the Navy's powerful 7th· Fleet, received com­ 
mendation in June for a job well done .. The 
commendation read in part: ". . . for highly 
efficient performance of duty over a period 
of approximately six months. This ship op­ 
erated in an advanced area, having completed 
without failure and without relief a heavy 
schedule of operations." Previous to his as­ 
signment in Pacific waters, in May, 1944, Lt. 
Bloom participated in antisubmarine duty in 
the Atlantic. 

1944 
S. Winifred Edwards, daughter of Dr. and 

Mrs. Charles R. Edwards of Baltimore, was 
married to Capt. Richard Tilghman Hemsley, 
III, in the First Methodist Church, Baltimore, 
Md., on August 5. Capt. Hemsley is a grad­ 
uate of Johns Hopkins and also of the U. S. 
Military Academy at West Point, N. Y. He 

Service :Notes 
by LT. ROBERT G. CRIST 
Co. I, Camp Ritchie, Md. 

Pfc. William S. Keown, '45, recently 
moved into Blytheville, Ark. (Sqd. A, 
BAAF) and missed by only a day or 
so meeting his fellow Beta, Pfc. Robert 
Slutzker, '46, who had moved on to 
Napier Field, Ala. (Box M-6). At 
Napier Slutzker immediately met 2nd 
Lt. John D. Hopper, also '46, who 
took him airplane joyriding, and later 
to visit Mrs. Hopper and their young 
daughter. 

Pfc. Robert T. Wheeler, "44, is one 
of the many D-men on Okinawa (APO 
33 i j , Field Hospital, c/o Postmaster, 
San Francisco). Bill Groh, '44, is 
another out ·there. 

W. 0. Vincent J. Schafmeister, '46, 
is due back in the States after 24 
months in the Aleutians. He never 
got home from the day the forty-four 
of us left Dickinson in February, 1943. 

Pfc. Charles A. Langner, '46, is 
rounding out 15 months in India where 
he is serving with the A.A.F. His CO 
is a Lt. Harry Eldredge, who was at 
Dickinson with the Air Cadets, and 
who married Elizabeth Ralston, '36, 
while he was there. Langner's address 
is 82nd Depot Supply Sqdn., APO 
492, c)o Postmaster, New York . 

Charles Saam, '42, recently was pro­ 
moted to T/4. His address is Hq. Co., 
62nd QM Base Depot, APO 513, c;/o 
Postmaster, New York. Charlie is at 
Verdun. He sees Lt. Andy Andrews, 
'43, who is stationed a few miles away. 
M/Sgt. William Watt, '45, was with 

the 15th Army at Remagen, Germany. 
tst Lt. Wilbur Zimmerman, '29 of 

Mechanicsburg, who taught in the York 
schools until he entered the Army in 
1942, is in the same company with me 
here at Ritchie. 

Last I heard from Pfc. William Gale 
he was an MP with the 76th Division 
doing occupational work at Jera'. 
Germany .. 

is serving in the Air Corps. 
W /0 William H. Mcinroy visited the Col­ 

lege the last day of August with his wife, the 
former Joan Thatcher. He had been serving 
on a tanker in the Atlantic for three months 
and was then awaiting assignment proba!bly 
to the Pacific. ' · 
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L. Jane Bowen has accepted a position as 
an analytical chemist in the research labora­ 
tory of the Eastern laboratory of Du Pont at 
Gibbstown, N. ]. 

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Raymond Elder of In­ 
dianapolis, Ind., have announced the marriage 
of their <laughter, Barbara Moorehead Elder, 
to Lt. Richard Henry Timberlake, Jr., on 
June 6. 

Lt. Ralph Wendell Schecter, Jr., of the 
U. S. Army Air Corps, was married to Miss 
Margaret Anne Norman, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. George Norman on June 16, at the 
Base Chapel, Langley Field, Va. Prof. and 
Mrs. Ralph W. Schecter attended the cere­ 
mony. The bride is an alumna of the Uni­ 
versity of North Carolina. Lt. Schecter served 
with the 15th Air Force throughout the Ital­ 
ian invasion and campaign. He is the holder 
of the Air Medal with three clusters, the 
European Theater Ribbon with five battle 
stars, the Purple Heart, and the Presidential 
Unit Citation with three clusters. 

Lt. John Pearson Miller, III, was married 
to Miss Emma Jane Burkholder, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Burkholder of Carlisle in 
St. John's Episcopal Church on July 28, 
shortly after his return on leave from Italy. 
Mrs. Miller is a graduate of the Carlisle High 
School and the Central Pennsylvania Business 
School, and for the past three .years was sec­ 
retary to the treasurer of the College. Lt. 
Miller is a veteran of 88 combat missions in 
the European theater. 

Lt. George Benedict, Jr., and Capt. George 
Myers, '42, are serving with the Marine Corps 
in one of the Marshall Islands. In a letter 
written July 31, Lt. Benedict reports: "I have 
a light anti-aircraft platoon, all colored boys, 
since the entire battalion is a Negro outfit, 
I find them tractable and pleasant to work 
with." 

Sgt. David M. Boyd is with an_ ordnance 
automotive maintenance outfit, stationed in the 
Ryukyu Islands. 

194.5 
Cpl. John Alden Myers has been in the 

field artillery for over two years, and has 
seen service at Hawaii and various islands of 
the group. 

Mr. and Mrs. James D. Shreve of Lan­ 
caster have announced the engagement of 
their daughter, Kathryn, to Sgt. Leslie W. 
Stone, Jr., of Scranton. Sgt. Stone, who grad­ 
uated from Franklin and Marshall College in 
1942, recently returned from the European 
theater of operations. 
Announcement has been made of the en­ 

gagement of Miss Ruth Riddle, daughter of 
Rev. Dr. and Mrs. Melvin W. Riddle of 
Chambersburg, to Ellsworth R. Browneller, 
Williamsport. Miss Ridde is a graduate of 
the Pennsylvania State Co!Jege and rs a 

teacher of home economics in the Coatesville 
Junior High School. Upon his entrance rn~d 
the Navy Browne!Jer studied at Franklm a 
Marshall,' and is now a student at Jefferson 
Medical College, Philadelphia. S t 

A veteran of D-Day in Normandy, g · 
Robert L. lipsitt, after a brief furlough, has 
been redeployed to the Pacific. He is with an 
assault signal company. 

·Catherine Price has acepted a position as d 
technician in the department of histology an 

1 anatomy at George Washing ton Medics 
School, and is living at 2746 S. Troy St., 
Arlington, Va. 

194.6 
Nick Papadeas is a sergeant in Army Air 

Commun1cat10ns. He is now stationed at 
Palmdale, Calif. 

Dr. and Mr;. Henry S. Weber of Philade_l­ 
phia have announced the marriage of their 
daughter, Margaret Gloria, to Joseph Allen 
Mathis, U. S. Navy, on March 10. 

. Pvt. Robert N. Pyle, who had been sta­ 
tioned at Camp Blanding, Fla., has been sent 
by the Army to the University of Minnesota, 
Minneapolis, Minn. 

Robert C. Slutzker who is stationed at 
Napier Field, Ala., ha's been promoted to the 
grade of corporal in the Army Air Forces. 

Phyllis G. Kennedy and Lt. John W. Galt 
of Carlisle were married on August 16 in the 
chapel of the· Carlisle Barracks. Mrs. Galt 
attended the Jefferson School of Nursing in 
Philadelphia. Lt. Galt, a graduate of Perkio­ 
men, was attending Penn State when he 
enlisted _in the Army Air Corps. The couple 
now reside at Miami Fla where Lt. Galt IS stationed. ' ., 

194.7 
Pvt. Fred Maurada of the Marine Corps 

completed his training at Parris Island and 
has been ''ssigned to a Japanese interpreter school. 

FIRST TO LAND ON JAPAN 
(Continued from page 26) 

hope I can bring home. I saw some of 
their ships and many of their planes. 
They have received terrific damage. The 
Japs appear as a people who are 
stunned." 

Of special interest to stamp collec­ 
tors is the fact that Ben was thoughtful 
enough in all the excitement to mail 
letters to many friends under the irn­ 
print "First Day Coveo=Tokyo Bay 
landing-August 30, 1945-USS Gar­ 
rard AP A 84." 
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I ________ o_B_I_T_u_A_R_Y _..JI 
t 1877-The Rev. Dr. Robert McKay, retired Episcopal minister of Moores­ 
own, N. J., died on June 5 at the Burlington County Hospital, Mt. Holly, N. J. 
C 

1 
Born March 17, 1856, in Boston, Dr. McKay received his A.B. from the 

. 
0 
lege m 1877, his A.M. in 1886, and the honorary degree of Doctor of Divinity 

In 1892. He was also a graduate of Drew Theological Seminary. He was a 
~ember of Phi Beta Kappa fraternity and Phi Kappa Psi. He became a member 
0 the Philadelphia Conference of the Methodist Church in 1879, and in 1894 he 
e~~ered the Protestant Episcopal .Church as rector of All Saints' Church, Philadel­ 
~ 1.a, where he served until 1899- From 1899 to 1915 he was rector of Trinity 
piscopal Church, Moorestown, and from 1915 to 1925, he was rector of St. 

Mary's Episcopal Church, Datona Beach, Florida. He then returned to Moorestown 

and retired in 1932. M Dr. McKay is survived by his wife, Harriet, and a son, the Rev. Robert B. 
cKay, pastor of St. Agnes' Church, Little Falls, N. J. 

1886-Frederick L. Smith, former mayor of Hazleton and retired member of 
the Luzerne County, Pa., Bar, died at the Masonic Homes, Elizabethtown, Pa., 
where he had served as librarian for some years, on April 27, 1945. He was 
badly crippled for years and became a permanent patient in the Masonic Hospital 

about five years ago. . Born in Hazleton, Pa., December 5, 1864, he was the son of Sampson and 
Elizabeth Lauderburn Smith. He attended the old Dickinson Preparatory School, 
entered the College in 1882, and received his Ph.B. degree' in 1886. He studied 
law at Columbia University Law School, and practiced his profession for some 
years in Hazleton. He served as mayor of that city from 1907. to 1910. He 
was a member of Theta Delta Chi fraternity. Interment was made in the Hazleton 

Cemetery. 

1888, 1892L-William DeWald Boyer, who served as a trustee of the College 
from 1901 to 1903, and was a former member of the Alumni Council, died in the 
Protestant Hospital, Nashville, Tenn., on August 3. He was admitted to the Hos­ 
pital two weeks before his death, and had been seriously' ill during that time. 

Born in Port Clinton, Pa., on May 28, 1867, he was the son of Samuel C. and 
R: Caroline Boyer. He entered the College in 1884. _upon his graduation from the 
high school at Pottsville, Pa. Following his graduat10n from the College in 1888 
with an A.B. degree, he was a teacher in the schools of Port ~linton_ until, in 1889, 
he entered the Dickinson School of Law from which he received his LLB. degree 
upon his graduation in 1892. The College awarded him the degree of A. M. in 
1891. He was admitted to the Luzerne County Bar !n ~cranton in 1892, and engaged 
in the coal business there for the greater part of his life. He was president of the 
Piney Coal and Coke Co., and of the Piney Mining Co. there, and also the Wallins 

Creek Coal Co. Seventeen years ago Mr. Boyer moved to Nashville, Tenn., and had served as 
president of the Fentress Coal and Goke Co. He was a member of Phi Kappa Psi, Phi Beta Kappa, the Belles Lettres Society, 

and .the Presbyterian Church 
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His wife, the former Miss Louise Alton Hosie of Brooklyn, N. Y. died about 
eight years ago. He is survived by two daughters, Mrs. E. M. Cameron, Jr. o.f 
Garden City, N. Y., and Mrs. Frank DePaw of Manhassett, N. Y.; a brother, A. l•. 
Boyer of Wilder, 'l enn.: a nephew, Samuel C Boyer of Nashville, two nieces, Mrs. 
J. T. Riddle of Nashville and Mrs. E. R. Kinnebrew of Philadelphia; and six grand­ 
children. 

Funeral services were held and burial made at EJk Lake at Montrose, Pa. 

1895~Col. Jay Wier Grissinger, retired Army Medical Corps officer, died at 
the Walter Reed Hospital, Washington, D_ C., on August 10 after an illness of 
several months. 

Born in Mechanicsburg on August 22, 1875, Col. Grissinger spent two years 
as a student of the College, then entered the Medical School of the University of 
Pennsylvania from which he received the M.D. degree in 1898. Following his 
internship he practiced for two years in York, Pa., and entered the Army as 
assistant surgeon_ with the rank of first lieutenant in 1902. During World War I 
he served as a lieutenant colonel, and was attached to the Rainbow Division. He 
was awarded the Distinguished Service Medal while serving in Germany as chief 
surgeon for the Third Army. Fol1owing the War, he was on the General Staff 
from 1920 to 1924, and was promoted to the grade of colonel in 1929. He had 
other foreign service in the Philippines, Alaska and the Hawaiian Islands. He was 
the author of "Conservation of Manpower in Theaters of Operations" and "Medical 
Field Service in France." 

He is survived by his wife, the former Mabel A. Underwood, of Mechanicsburg, 
and two sons, John Underwood Grissinger and Theodore Underwood Grissinger. 

Burial was made in Arlington National Cemetery. 

1896-James L. N. Channell, prominent attorney of Pottsville, Pa., died .in the 
hospital there of coronary thrombosis on June 15, three weeks after he had suffered 
a heart attack. 

While an undergraduate, he was one of the seven founders of Ravens Claw, 
senior honorary society, and he was also a member of Beta Theta Pi fraternity. A 
few years ago he presented a game room to the fraternity house in memory of his 
son, James M. Channell, '38, after his accidental death. 

Born on November 11, 1876, in Pine Grove, Pa., he was the son of George W. 
and Louise F. Channell. He received his A. B. degree in 1896, and then taught 
Latin for a year in the Shortlidge Aca?emy at Media, Pa. He then read law in the 
office of Judge Richard Koch of Pottsville, and was admitted to the Bar of Schuylkill 
County in 1900. 

During his undergraduate days at the' ~ollege he was a member of the football 
and baseball teams, of the Union Philosophical Society, and of the glee club and 
orchestra. He maintained his interest in athletics, and in 1904 served as football 
coach for the Pottsville High School team. He was also an enthusiastic golfer. 

He was a member of the Examining Board of the Schuylkill County Bar Asso­ 
ciation, the Pottsville and Schuylkill County Club and B. P. 0. E. 207 of which he 
served as exalted ruler in 1914. He was a former U. S. Commissioner, solicitor for 
the Anti-Tuberculosis Society, former city solicitor for Pottsville and the boroughs 
of Port Carbon and Pine Grove. 
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. In 1903 he married a talented violinist of Pottsville,· Alma Miehle, who sur- 
vives him. He is also survived by his daughter, Mrs. Edith Louise Yuengli~g, a 
.ga~ddaughter, Edith Louise, and his brother and classmate, Rev. Wayne Channell, 

· ., of Mountain Home, Pa. 
Burial was made in the Charles Baber Cemetery, Pottsville. 

. is?6-The Rev. Samuel Travena Jackson, who was closely associated for many 
years with. Fanny Crosby, the blind hymn writer, and who wrote her biography, died 
ar Tr_anqu1hty, N. J., on July 1. "Fanny Crosby's Story of Ninety-Four Years" is 
~ow ID its 20th edition. Dr. Jackson was also the author of "The Wayward Child," 
.. From the Palace to the Gallows," "The Message of the Cambridgian Poets," and 

Tolstoi, The People's Prophet." C A few years ago he gave his own library of 2,000 volumes to Florida Southern 
ollege at Lakeland, where it occupies a room as a memorial to him . 

. Born at Cornwall, England, on December 8, 1809, he prepared for college at 
~~ckettstown,_ N. J., Seminary. After a ye~r at Dickinson, he trans_ferred to Illinois 

_esleyan University, from which he received the Ph. B. degree m 1896. He re­ 
cerveq his A. M. from New York University, and his Ph. D. from Taylor University. 

He also did graduate work at Harvard University . 
. Entering the Newark Conference of the Methodist Church in 1895, he served 

vanous charges throughout the Conference until his retirement some years ago. 
He was married on December 29, 1902, to Miss Rea Robinson of Orange 

County, N. Y., who survives him with their two daughters, Mrs. J. B. McKenzie 

and Mrs. Vernet A. Arnold. 

1897L-James P. Costello died after a long illness at his home in Hazleton, 
Pa., on July 22 at the age of eighty-two years. .. A. graduate of Bloomsburg State Normal School, Mr. Costello se~ve? several 
te:ms ID Common and Select Council and was a member of the bui!d1Dg com­ 
mittee that designed the City Hall in Hazkton. His son, James P. Costello, Jr., 

was mayor of that city. He is also survived by his wife, Mrs. Theresa C. Costello, and three other 

sons. 

1898-Dr. Joseph Vernon Adams, member of the Central Pennsylvania Con­ 
ference, died in the parsonage at Muncy,. Pa., on Feb. 20_. The son of John and 
Mary Jane Adams, he was born at Clearville, Pa., on April 13, 1874. The family 
moved to Bedford where he attended the schools and later, Dickinson Preparatory 
School. He graduated from the College in 1898 with an A.B. degree, and later he 

earned his doctorate in philosophy. While a student at Dickinson where be became a member of the Phi Delta Theta 
fraternity, he was active in the musical groups, and for a time was leader of the choir 

of Allison Methodist Church. He was married Aug. 10, 1898, to Miss ~ettie Brengle, who died June 20, 
1943. Their two daughters, Mrs. H. M. Emb1~k of. New Cumberland, Pa., and 
Mrs. Kenneth Wright of Oak Ridge, Tenn., surv1v_e him. He was later married to 
Mrs. Laura H. Bierly of Renovo, Pa., who also survives. 

Admitted to the Central Pennsylvania Conference in 1898, Dr. Adams filled 
many of the important appointments during his years in the ministry, and also 
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served on various important committees of the Conference. Possessing poetic ability, 
some of his poems were published in local newspapers. 

Following funeral services at Muncy, interment was made in Mt. Olivet 
Cemetery New Cumberland, Pa. 

1901-Steward Flager Shiffer, treasurer of the Stroudsburg Security Trust Com­ 
pany, died of a heart attack on June 27 at Stroudsburg, Pa. He was 66 years old, 
and only a few months before his death received news of the death in action of 
his aviator son, Thomas. 

Born in Stroudsburg on February 3, 1879, he attended the schools there and 
the Dickinson Preparatory School. He was graduated from the College with a 
Ph.B. degree in 1901 and then spent a year as a student in the Dickinson 
School of Law. In college he was an outstanding athlete in baseball and football, 
serving as football captain in 1900. He was a member of Phi Delta Theta 
fraternity. 

Following his college career he took over a laundry business in Philadelphia, 
and later became associated with his father in the contracting business m Strouds­ 
burg. In August, 1909, he entered the bank which he served for thirty-six years. 
He was a director and president of the East Stroudsburg Savings Building and 
Loan Association. He was a member of the First Presbyterian Church. His sur­ 
vivors are his widow, who was Grace Greenwald, and a brother, Rudolph, at 
Claremont, Va. 

1903-Theodore D. Sloat, president and proprietor of the Garden T Shoppes, 
Inc., died on July 5 at Georgetown University Hospital after an eight-weeks ill­ 
ness of coronary thrombosis. 

Born in Washington, D. C., on August 25, 1879, he was the son of Jesse B. 
and Emma J. Sloat. He attended the Eastern High School and the Dickinson 
Preparatory School. Entering the College in 1899, he received the A.B. degree 
upon his graduation in 1903. 

He entered the restaurant business in Washington more than 30 years ago. 
Among the eating and catering establishments which he operated at various times 
was the cafe at the Congressional Li!brary. 

Mr. Sloat was a former president of the Washington Restaurant Association, 
and a former third vice-president of the Merchants and Manufacturers Association. 
He was a memberof the Board of Trade, the Kiwanis Club, the Columbia Country 
Club, and Beta Theta Pi fraternity. 

He is survived by his widow, Mrs. Portia H. Sloat, 3025 Cathedral Street, 
N. W., and a brother, Col. J. Irving Sloat, surgeon of the regional hospital at 
Fort Ord, Calif. 

1905-The Rev. Elmer Franklin Ilgenfritz died suddenly of a heart attack on 
April 20 while attending the ses.sions of the C~ntral Pennsylvania Conferenc~ of the 
Methodist Church which was bemg held in Williamsport. At the time of his death 
he was pastor of the Methodist Church }n Ne~copeck, Pa. ~e had no warning and 
apparently was in good health. He ~ad just alighted from ~1s car at the hor.ne of his 
host when he was stricken, becommg unconscious immediately, and passmg away 
within a half hour without regaining consciousness. 

Born in York, Pa., on Sept. 30, 1879, he attended York County Academy and 
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Dickinson Seminary. He graduated from the College in 1905. While an under­ 
fraduate in 1903 he was admitted to membership in the Central Pennsylvania Con­ 
. erence and ordained an elder .in 1906. Among the charges served during his min­ 
istry were churches in Altoona, Tyrone and Waynesboro. He is survived by his 
~ife, two daughters, Phyllis, at home, and Mrs. George F. Bagbey, of Arlington, 

. a., and a son, E. Renn I!genfritz, Washington, D. C He is also survived by two 
sisters Mrs. Annie Sheaffer, of Harrisburg, and Mrs. W. S. Thomas of Detroit. 

~uneral services were held in Third Street Methodist Church2 Williamsport, of 
which he had formerly been pastor, and interment was made in the Lincoln Cemetery, 

Chambersburg, Pa. 
1915-Edward C. Boss died following a heart attack at his home in Pittsburgh 

on March 12. He was a mechanical engineer, and at the time of his death was 
employed by the Loftus Engineering Company of' Pitt~burgh. He had been em­ 
ployed by the Central Iron and Steel Company of Harrisburg, the New York 
Central Iron Work, Hagestown, Md., and the Rust Furnace Company, Pittsburgh. 

Th~ son of James J. and Sarah L. B. Boss, he was born in Baltimore, Md., 
on Apnl 23, 1892. He prepared for college at the Laurel High School and 
Conway Hall, and had also been a student at Maryland Agricultural College. He 
was. a member of Phi Kappa Sigma fraternity. . . 

. On October 19, 1918, he married Rheda Irene Bird of Harnsburg. She sur- 
vives and also a son, Pfc. Edward C. Boss, Jr., who is with the Army in Germany. 

· Their other son, James Howard Boss, died shortly after his birth on January 6, 

1922. Following funeral serv(ces, interment was made in Bethel Cemetery, Pittsburgh. 

1924L-Thomas G. Siddall, retired Army major, former Atlantic County 
common pleas judge and former Assistant New Jersey Attorney General, was found 
dead on July 28 in his suite at the Loumar Apartments in Atlantic City. His age 
w.as 50. Death was attributed to a heart attack. Mr. Siddall studied for three years at the Wharton School of Finance of 
the University of Pennsylvania, and later received a law ?egree at Dickinson School 
of Law. He was appointed .!_o the New Jersey Bar in 1926. He was named 
n:iaster in chancery and counselor in 1931; New Jersey Supreme Court Commis­ 
stoner in 1939, and Atlantic County common pleas judge on June 12, 1940. 

Surviving are his mother, Mrs. Catherine Siddall, and a sister, Mrs. Martin 
Ford, both of Philadelphia, and a brother, Lester D. Siddall, of South Orange, N. J. 

NECROLOGY 

Mrs. Mabel McClintock Sigmund, wife of John Luther Sigmund, '98, and 
mother of Mrs. Sara Sigmund Lynch, '26, died after a lingering illness at the 
home of her daughter in Wayne, Pa., on June 11. Interment was made in Cedar 

Hills Cemetery at Salena, Pa. 

Mrs. Linnie May Bucke, wife of the Rev. J. E. A. Bucke, D.D., pastor of 
the Newport Methodist Church, died on May 25. Dr. Bucke received his honorary 

degree from the College. 
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; ·Mrs. Bucke was the mother of Dr. Elizabeth B. Miller, '23, of Wilmingto~, 
the Rev. D. Percy Bucke, '29, of Yiork, and the Rev. Emory Stevens Bucke, wh.o 1~ 
on the staff of Zion! r Herald, Boston, Mass. In addition to· them, she is survived 
by a brother, Howard E. Coulter of Liverpool, and a sister, Mrs. Harry W. Shutt 
of Harrisburg. . 

During her husband's pastorates in various churches, Mrs. Bucke was actt~e 
in a number of church organizations. She also held several offices in the women s 
organizations of the Central Pennsylvania Conference. 

C. Guiles Flower, father of four Dickinsonians, died on August 8 a few 
hours after suffering a cerebral hemorrhage at his home. 

He is survived by his wife, Mrs. Lenore Embick Flower; a daughter, Mrs. 
Kenneth F. Donahue, '35, of Washington, D. C.; and three sons, Milton E. 
Flower, '31, a member of the Carlisle High School faculty; Guiles Flower, Jr., '39, 
chemist with Celenese Corporation at Kingsville, Tex.; and Lt. James D. Flower, 
'42, of the Coast Artillery, who has been in the Pacific for the past two years 
and is now in Manila. 

Prior to his retirement seventeen months ago Mr. Flower was superintendent 
of the West End Post Office in Harrisburg, and had been in the government 
service for forty-two years. He was a member of the First Lutheran Church of 
Carlisle, a former member . of the church council, a past president of the Men's 
Bible Class, and at the time of his death, treasurer of the Sunday School. He 
was a member of Robert Burns Lodge, F. and A. M. of Harrisburg and of the 
Harrisburg Consistory. 

The Rev. Dr. George H. Lorah, minister of the Green Street Methodist Church 
of Philadelphia for the last forty-nine years, died of a heart attack at his summer 
home in Doylestown, Pa., on August 30. He was eighty-two years old. 

Dr. Lorah was educated at Drew University, and the College conferred the 
honorary degree of Doctor of Laws on him in 1919. He held many important 
posts in the Philadelphia Conference of the Methodist Church. 

Jacob Wiener, father of two J?ickinsonians, retired clothing merchant who ~as 
prominently identified with the busm~ss life of Carlisle for more than 50 yea~s, died 
at his home on August 26 after an illness of four months. He observed his 84th 
birthday on August 15, and had been bedfast since suffering a heart attack in May. 

He was the father of Mrs. Amelia K. Blumenfeld, '16, of Starkville, Miss., and 
Mrs. William Smethurst, '25, of Montclair, N. J. In addition to his two daughters, 
he is survived by his wife, Mrs. Blanche Kronenberg Wiener, two grandsons and a 
niece. 

Q 



DIRECTORY OF ALUMNI CLUBS 

Dickinson Club of Altoona 
~rk H. Loose. '27 President 
R argaret N. Horner, '30 Vice-Presidem; 
~-· G. H. Ketterer, D. D., '08, Secretary 

arr-iors Tvliark [Pa 
John M. Klepser. ·22 Trea.surer 

Dickinson Club of Atlantic City 
tlarjorle L. Mcintire, '10 President 
.. oyd E. Spangler, '22 Vice-President 
... abet E. Kirk, '05 Secretary-Treasurer 
4301 Atlantic Ave., Atlantic City, N. J. 

Dickinson Club of Baltimore 
Di' M. G. Porter, '84 President f arence M. Shepherd, '10 .. Vice-President 
dene G. Yaeger, '42 Treasurer 

· Wesley Orem, '35 Secretary 
4109 Priscilla Lane, Colonial Village, 
Prkesvtlte, Md. 

Dickinson Club of Boston 
Pioward W. Selby, '13 President 
A. Norman Needy, '16, Secretary-Treasurer 
236 BeUevue St., West Newton, Mass. 

Dickinson Club of California 
Robert Hays Smith, '98L President 
Samuel H. Beetem, '92 Vice-President 
Joseph Z. Hertzler, '13, Secretary-Treasurer 
1865 Sacramento St .. San Francisco. Cal. 

Dickinson ·ClUJb of •Chicago 
Samuel W. wrtwer, Jr., '30 President 
Dr. !Pierce Butler, '06 Woe-President 
Mrs. William G. Gmy secty.-Treas. 

•128 [,aurel Ave., Wilmette, Ill. 
Dickinson Club of Delaware 

Leonard G. Hagner, '15 PresLdent 
Leslie H. Gluckman, '27iL .. Vlce-tPresident 
Dr. John Shilling '08 Vice-President 
W · Fred Burton, ''17 Vloe-President 
Ivy M. Hudson. '23 Secretary 

Wyoming, Delaware 
Edward C. First. Jr., '35 Treasurer 

Dickinson Club of Harrisburg 
Rev. Spencer B Smith '34 .... President 
Sol HuDwitz, ·26, '28L ' .... Vice-President 
Mrs. Blanche R. Sl!IIllIIloi:J.s, '2!5, Vice-!President 
William Fry, '28L ..... Secretary-Treasurer 
331 Market St., Harrisburg, iPa. 

Dickinson Club of Michigan 
Roscoe O. Bonisteel '12 Preside11t 
Ellsworth H. Mish, ''09 Vice-President 
Wendell J. LaCoe, '26, secretary-Treasurer 
511 Pauline Blvd., Ann Arbor, Mich. 

Dickinson Club of New York 
Mervin G. Eppley, '17 President 
Dr. Irving A. Marsland, '14, Vice-President 
Dr. J. Edgar Washabaugh, '08, Secty-Treas. 
56 Washington Ave., Morristown, N. J. 

Dickinson Alumni Association of 
Northeastern Pennsylvania 

Judge John s. Fine, '14L President 
Richard L. Bigelow '08L .. Vice-President 
Harry A. Kolb, '14L Vice-President 
John L. Mangan '30 _ Treasurer 
Hopkin T. Rowl~nds, '31L Secretary 
930 Miners National Bank Bldg., WllkeR- 
Barre, Pa. 

Dicldnson Club of Northern New Jersey 
Rev. E. F. Hallock, '30 President 
John P. Milligan, '26 Vice-President 
Rov D. Tolliver, '31 .. Secretary-Treasurer 
425 Holmes se., Boonton, N. J. 

Dickinson Club of Ohio 
w. Miller cook, '19 President 
Blake Womer, '19 Vice-President 
Mrs. Henrv w. Lyndall, Jr., '35 Secretary-Treasurer 

1867 Noble na.. East Cleveland, Q. 

Dickinson Club of Philadelphia 
Rev. Alex K. Smith, D.D., '25 ... President 
Murrav H. Spahr. '12 ViceciPresldent 
Mrs. :Margaret D. Jones, '15, Vi-0e-1Pres1dent 
Dr. William c. Sampson, '02 .. Secy.-Treas. 

Upper oarby, Pa. 

Dickinson club of Pittsburgh 
Nicholas Unkovic, '32L .. , ..... President 
Mrs. R. c. Mcffi1fish, '14 ... Vioe-President 
Thomas E. Whitten, '26L, secretary-Treas. 
818 Frick Bldg., Pittsburgh, Pa. 

Dicldnson Club of Reading-Berks 
Robert H. Stewart, '27 President 
Walter A. Schlegel. '27 Vice-President 
Edna M. L. Handwork, '12 .. secy.-Treas. 
Birdsboro, Pa. 
Dickinson Club of southern New Jersey 
Evan D. Pearson, '38 President 
Leighton J. Heller, '23, '25L, Vice-President 
Mrs. James K. Lower, '37 .... Secty.-Treas. 
177 Johnson se., Salem, N. J. 

Dickinson Club of Central New Jersey 
John H. Platt, '25 President 
Royce V. Haines. '30 Vice-President 
Mrs. John J. Duffy, '39 VLce-President 
Douglas B. Wicoff, '35L, Secretary-Treai;. 
Broad Street Bank Bldg., Trenton. N. J 

Dickinson Club of Washin~ton 
aev. Edward G. Latch, D.D., '21, President 
Dr. F. Y. Jaggers, .rr., •3.9 .. Vice-lJ?resldent 
Maude E. Wilson, '14 secretarv 

1789· Lanle.r Place. Washington. D. C. 
Paul A. MRngan. '34 TreasureT 
Dickinson club of west Branch Valley 

j udge G. 1S. Williams, '26, '281L, President 
Lee M. Bowes' ,29 Vice-President 
Mrs. S. B. Davis, '32 Secty.-Treas. 
8~8 w. 4th St., Willlamsport, Pa. 

Dickinson Club of York 
Earl M. Schroeder, '26 President 
DorothY M. Badders, '32 .. Vice-President 
J. R. '.Budding, '3·2, '36L ..... 1Secty.-Treas. 

19 East Marl<et St., York, Pa. 
New York Alumnae Club 

Linette E. Lee, '09 President 
Anna M. Mohler, '17 Vice-President 
Mrs. E. S. Jenkins, '10., Secretary-Treasurer 
Gordon Road, Essex Fells, N. J. 

Philadelphia Alumnae Club 
Grace Filler, '10 President 
Mrs. R. L. Sharp, '24 Vice-President 
Jane D. Shenton, '11, Secretary-Treasurer 

544 E. Woodlawn sve., Germantown. 
Philadelphia. Pa. 




